
CITY OF HANNIBAL 
 

OFFICIAL COUNCIL AGENDA 
 
 
 

Tuesday, April 16, 2019 
Council Chambers 

7:00 p.m. 
 
 

ROLL CALL 
 

 
CALL TO ORDER 

 
 

INVOCATION 
 

 
PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 

 
 

APPROVAL OF AGENDA 
 

 
APPROVAL OF MINUTES 

Regularly Scheduled Council Meeting – April 2, 2019 
 

 
APPROVAL OF PAYROLL AND CLAIMS 

First Half – April, 2019 
 
 

JACOB GREVING – HANNIBAL SCHOOL DISTRICT 
Re:  Request, Street Closures – HHS Commencement Ceremony 

Thursday, May, 2019h – 6:45 p.m. – 8:30 p.m. 
 
 

DANA RUHL – 12416 NEW LONDON GRAVEL ROAD 
Re: Request, Medical Marijuana Zoning Setback – 1,000 Feet from Schools  

 
 
 
 
 



ANDY DORIAN – DIRECTOR, PARKS & RECREATION 
Re:  Bid Award Approval, Annual Street Materials 

 
Re:  Bid Award Approval, 4 Foot Tree Grates 

OCCOutdoors - $228.16 (each) 
 

Re: Huckleberry Park Tennis Courts Resurfacing - Contract 
Helfers Lawn & Landscape, LLC DBA Sport Court St. Louis - $33,700 

(Resolution No. 2202-19 to follow) 
 

Re:  Sodalis Nature Preserve – First Amendment to Deed of Conservation Easement  
Iowa Natural Heritage Foundation  
 (Resolution No. 2203-19, to follow) 

 
 

RYAN NEISEN – DEPUTY FIRE CHIEF 
Re: Hazmat Trailer Gas Monitoring Devices (4) – Grant Application & Subsequent 

Documents 
Missouri Department of Public Safety – State Homeland Security Program - $11,650.32 

(Resolution No. 2204-19, to follow) 
 
 

MIKE BENJAMIN – FIRE CHIEF 
Re: Code Amendment, Chapter 12, Section 12-23 

• Section 12-23 - Qualifications of members  
• Section 12-34. - Working hours 

(Bill No. 19-006, to follow) 
 

 
JOEY BURNHAM – BUILDING INSPECTOR 

Re:  Old Baptist Cemetery Mowing – Contract Agreement 
Simply Cut Lawns - $3,600 

(Resolution No. 2206-19, to follow) 
 

 
EDIE PRICE – DPW MANAGEMENT ASSISTANT 

Re:  Five-Year Capital Improvement Plan – 2020-2024 
(Resolution No. 2205-19, to follow) 

 
Re: Code Amendment, Chapter 32 

Medical Marijuana Facility Uses 
(Bill No. 19-007, to follow) 

 
 

 
 



RESOLUTION NO.  2202-19 
 

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR TO EXECUTE AN 
AGREEMENT BETWEEN THE CITY OF HANNIBAL AND 

HELFERS LAWN & LANDSCAPE, LLC DBA SPORT COURT  ST. 
LOUIS IN THE AMOUNT OF $33,700 FOR THE CLEANING AND 

RESURFACING OF THE FOUR TENNIS/PICKLEBALL COURTS IN 
HUCKLEBERRY PARK   

 
 
 
 

RESOLUTION NO.  2203-19 
 
A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR TO EXECUTE THE 

FIRST AMENDMENT TO THE DEED OF CONSERVATION 
EASEMENT BETWEEN THE CITY OF HANNIBAL AND IOWA 

NATURAL HERITAGE FOUNDATION PARTIES TO A DEED OF 
CONSERVATION EASMENT DATED AND FILED ON JANUARY 13, 

2016 IN THE OFFICE OF THE MARION COUNTY, MISSOURI 
RECORDER AS DOCUMENT NUMBER 2016R000108 

CONCERNING CERTAIN REAL PROPERTY LEGALLY 
DESCRIBED IN EXHIBIT A THERETO (“PROPERTY”)  

 
 
 
 

RESOLUTION NO. 2204-19 
 

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF HANNIBAL AUTHORIZING 
THE GRANT APPLICATION PROCESS AND SUBSEQUENT 

ACCEPTANCE DOCUMENTS FOR THE MISSOURI DEPARTMENT 
OF PUBLIC SAFETY THROUGH THE STATE HOMELAND 

SECURITY PROGRAM FOR AN AWARD OF $11,650.32 
 
 
 



RESOLUTION NO. 2205-19 
 

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF HANNIBAL, MISSOURI, 
APPROVING AND ADOPTING THE FIVE-YEAR CAPITAL 
IMPROVEMENT PROGRAM 2020-2024 FOR THE CITY OF 

HANNIBAL, MISSOURI 
 
 
 
 

RESOLUTION NO.  2206-19 
 

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR TO EXECUTE A 
CONTRACT BETWEEN THE CITY OF HANNIBAL AND SIMPLY 

CUT LAWNS FOR 2019-2020 OLD BAPTIST CEMETERY MOWING, 
IN THE AMOUNT OF $3,600.00 

 
 
 
 

BILL NO. 19-005 
 

AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING THE 
ISSUANCE OF WATERWORKS REVENUE 

BONDS, SERIES 2019, OF THE CITY OF 
HANNIBAL, MISSOURI; PRESCRIBING THE 
FORM AND DETAILS OF THE BONDS AND 
THE COVENANTS AND AGREEMENTS TO 

PROVIDE FOR THE PAYMENT AND 
SECURITY THEREOF; AND AUTHORIZING 
CERTAIN ACTIONS AND DOCUMENTS AND 

PRESCRIBING OTHER MATTERS RELATING 
THERETO 

 
 

Second & Final Reading 
 



BILL NO.  19-006  
 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF HANNIBAL AMENDING 
CHAPTER 12, SECTION 12-23 OF THE ORDINANCES OF 

REVOKING THE EXISTING SECTION AND ENACTING A NEW 
SECTION 12-23 IN IT’S PLACE 

 
First Reading 

 
 
 
 

BILL NO.  19-007 
 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF HANNIBAL, AMENDING 
CHAPTER 32 OF THE HANNIBAL MUNICIPAL CODE RELATIVE 

TO PASSAGE OF STATEWIDE AMENDMENT 2 AND 
INCORPORATING VARIOUS MEDICAL MARIJUANA FACILITY 
USES INTO APPROPRIATE ZONING DISTRICTS OF THE CITY 

 
First Reading 

 
 
 
 

CLOSED SESSION 
In Accordance with RSMo. 610.021 (1) (2) (3) & (12) 

o Potential Litigation 
o Real Estate  
o Personnel 
o Contract Negotiations 

 
 
 
 
 

ADJOURNMENT 











 

                  
        
 
 

MEMORANDUM 
 
To:  Mayor and City Council   
 
From: Andy Dorian – Director, Parks Recreation 
    
Re:  Approval of Annual Materials 
 
Date: April 10, 2019 
 

 
On Tuesday April 10th, 2019 the Hannibal Street Department went out for bids on our Annual 
Materials.  The Big Tabulation’s came in on the attached sheets, but I would like to give a price 
breakdown of each bid and any changes from our bids last year. 
 
I recommend the bid award go to the following suppliers: 

 
 

Gasoline and Diesel Fuel SD-2019/20-3 
Single bidder was Big River Oil 

 
Fuel Items   2018/19   2019/20 
No lead gasoline  $2.20    $2.18 
No Lead Premium  $2.56    $2.34 
#2 Diesel   $2.43    $2.51 
Winter Blend Diesel  $2.43    $2.51 
Off Road Diesel  $2.01    $2.27 
Boat Harbor   $2.49    $2.47 
 
Prices on our fuel took a split down the middle this year on pricing, our regular fuel dropped in 
pricing, but our diesel fuel raised in costs. We did receive a cover letter from Big River Oil that 
stated our Smart Cards/Flex Fuel cards used at the bulk plant, General Store or Boland Tire 
would ensure cheaper prices for us between $.02 and $.10 cents, but we no longer use these 
cards.  I called to confirm that our Wex Fuel cards would offer the same discount and per John 
Brokes, their Fuels Manager this will be honored with the Wex Cards as well. 
 
 
 



Aggregates SD-2019/20-4 
Single bidder was Central Stone 
 
  
 
Item     2018/19   2019/20 
Type 1 or 2 Flex Base   $8.35    $8.65 
Commercial Flex Base  $8.35    $8.65 
1-1/2 Surfacing   $8.70    $8.85 
½” Bituminous Surface  $13.85    $14.50 
3/8” Seal Coat    $13.85    $14.50 
Granular Fill    $5.60    $5.70 
Quarry Run    $8.60    $8.95 
1” Resurfacing   $9.20    $9.65 
Rip Rap    $17.20    $17.95 
3/8 Seal Coat (gravel)   $14.70    $15.30 
Concrete Sand    $8.00    $8.30 
Manufactured Sand   $11.40    $11.90 
CA16 ¼” Washed Chips  $13.85    $14.50 
3” Oversize Rock   $9.70    $10.10 
1 Inch Clean        $12.00 
 
Rock prices increased on each line item from our bid last year.  This potentially could have a 
huge impact on our budget for the upcoming year.  
 
 
 
Liquid Calcium Chloride SD-2019/20-5 
Two Bidders: 
 
SICALCO    $.83/gallon 
Missouri Petroleum Products  $1.27/gallon 
 
Item     2018/19   2019/20 
Liquid Calcium Chloride  $.83    $.83 
         $1.27 
 
This year we received two bids for our Liquid Calcium Chloride Bid.  The bid from SICALCO 
was the same as last year but does require a 4-day waiting period for product.  The bid from MO 
State Petroleum came in at a much higher price at $1.27 per gallon but we can receive in a 24-
hour period if necessary.  Our crews have always been very responsible at knowing when our 
supplies are running low to order so that we don’t find ourselves in a position to need to order in 
an emergency and feel confident in using the bid from SICALCO.  We have used this company 
the past few years and have been satisfied in their product.  
 
 



 
 
Concrete SD-2019/20-6 
2 Bidders: 
 
Bleigh Ready Mix  $117.50/cubic yard with $40.00 demurrage charge after one hour.   
Mark Twain Ready Mix $116.50/cubic yard with $40.00 demurrage charge after one hour.  
 
Item   Bidder   2018/19   2019/20 
Concrete Bleigh   $117.50/$40.00 hour  $117.50/$40.00 hour 
  MT Ready Mix $116.50/$40.00 hour  $116.50/$40.00 hour 
 
This upcoming year for our concrete bids we would like to allow for both companies to have an 
open bid.  The reason being is that if one of the companies listed above is currently pouring a 
bigger concrete job elsewhere, we may not be able to get the concrete that we need due to low 
supply.  If both companies have an open bid, then we could use the other company if the above 
situation occurred. Also, the price didn’t change from the bids that were received last year so our 
budgeted amounts can remain the same as last year.  
 
 
 
 
CLSM (Flowable Fill) SD-2019/20-7 
2 Bidders: 
 
Bleigh Ready Mix   $82.00 with $40.00 demurrage charge after one hour. 
Mark Twain Ready Mix  $93.00 with $40.00 demurrage charge after one hour. 
 
Item   Bidder   2018/19   2019/20 
CLSM  Bleigh   $92.00/$40.00 hour  $82.00/$40.00 hour 
  MT Ready Mix $93.00/$40.00 hour  $93.00/$40.00 hour 
 
Bleigh Ready Mix came in substantially lower in price this year with a bid that is $11.00 cheaper 
per cubic yard than mark Twain Ready Mix.  This bid is also $10.00 cheaper than what the bid 
was sitting at one year ago which will help with our budget pricing.  It will be our 
recommendation to use only Bleigh Ready Mix for the CLSM this year.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Cold Patch SD2019/20-8 
2 Bidders: 
 
Diamond Construction Missouri-No Bid    Illinois $115.00 
Emery Sapp & Sons  Missouri All Season Summer No Bid  Illinois-No Bid 
    Missouri All Season Winter   No Bid 
    Missouri UPM   $130.00 
 
Item   Bidder   2018/19   2019/20 
Cold Patch C.B. Asphalt  $120.00   No Bid 
     $120.00   No Bid 
     $120.00   No Bid 
  Diamond  $115.00   $115.00 
  Emory Sapp & Son     $130.00 
 
 
Two bids were received this year for our asphalt bid, Diamond Construction and Emery Sapp 
and Sons.  Emery Sapp and Sons has replaced CB Asphalt but will work out of the same asphalt 
plants that we have obtained asphalt in the past.  Normally we purchase all our asphalt locally 
here from the Hannibal plant but there have been a few instances where this plant has been down 
or only mixing for another job and we are unable to get the supply we need.  In this instance it is 
nice to have a back up plant to get patch at if needed.  The bids this year came in the same for 
Diamond in the amount of $115.00 a ton and higher with Emery at $130.00 a ton.  Last year our 
numbers were $120.00 a ton for our local plant.  Even though our number have increased we 
would like permission to accept both bids for the reasons stated above.  
 
 
Asphalt SD-2019/20-9 
2 Bidders: 
 
Diamond Asphalt Missouri-No Bid  Illinois $65.00/per ton 
Emery  Sapp & Sons Missouri $64.00/per ton Illinois-No Bid 
 
Item   Bidder   2018/19   2019/20 
Asphalt C.B. Asphalt  $60.00    No Bid 
  Diamond  $65.00    $65.00 
  Emery Sapp & Sons     $64.00 
 
 
Two bids were received this year for our asphalt bid, Diamond Construction and Emery Sapp 
and Sons.  Emery Sapp and Sons has replaced CB Asphalt but will work out of the same asphalt 
plants that we have obtained asphalt from in the past.  Over the last few years we have asked 
Council to accept the bids from both companies since they have been so close in price and in 
case we ran into an instance where our local plant wasn’t running and we needed asphalt we had 
the option to go into Illinois and purchase it as an option.  Since the bids came in close in price 
again this year, we would again like to ask for that option.  Our bids came in close with a slight 



increase from Emery Sapp and Sons from $60.00 last year per ton (CB Asphalt) to $64.00 ton 
this year.  
 
 
 
 
Snow Removal Salt SD-2019/20-10 
Two Bidders: 
 
Compass Minerals $86.50  per ton charge with a 5-7 deliver day window  
(term conditions attached) 
Cargill Salt  $105.59 per ton charge with a 3-5 deliver day window 
 
 
     2018/19  2019/20 
Item  Compass  $80.54   $86.50 
Salt  Cargill   $97.63   $105.59 
  
 
Two bids were received this year for rock salt. The low quote was from Compass Minerals at 
$86.50/ton. This also came with a stipulation that we must purchase at least 400 tons. This is 
more then we usually purchase in one year but I would like to go ahead and get a large stockpile 
in place. If we have a mild winter next year we may not need to purchase any or very little salt 
the following year. If we have a bad winter like we did this year, we will have plenty of supply 
and no need to scramble for more during the winter.  
 
Thank you for consideration on our bid tabulations. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  
 

































 

 

 
 

 
 

MEMORANDUM 
 
To: Mayor Hark and Members of the Hannibal City Council 
 
From: Andy Dorian, Parks & Recreation Director 
 
Re: Down Town Tree Grates 
 
Date: April 8, 2019 
 

On Monday, April 1th, 2019 The Department of Public Works went out for bid for 50 Tree Grate 
Squares that will be used along the Main Street Corridors and eventually up Broadway for the 
Treescape Project.  One bid was received from OCC Outdoors, INC in the amount of $228.16 
per unit amount for each tree grate.   
 
After some deliberation with the Tree Board another idea was brought to the table to investigate 
doing some decorative fencing around the trees instead of the grates.  It was decided amongst the 
Tree Board to order one of the grates and have one set of fencing fabricated to see what design 
fits better in the space and then use the alternative option in a park so that its not wasted. 
 
Staff recommends awarding the bid to OCC Outdoors for the unit price of $228.16 a grate but 
only order one unit until we are completely certain this is the route the City and Tree Board want 
to take.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 









Parks and Recreation 
Andrew Dorian 
Director of Parks & Recreation 
City of Hannibal 
320 Broadway 
Hannibal, MO 63401 
Ph: 573 221-0154   Fax: 573 221-0155 
Email:  adorian@hannibal-mo.gov 
 
  
TO: City Clerk, City Manager, City Council and Mayor 
 
FROM: Andrew Dorian 
 
DATE:  4/8/2019  
 
RE:  Huckleberry Tennis/Pickleball Court Resurfacing 
 
We recently opened bids for the cleaning and resurfacing of the Huckleberry 
Tennis/Pickleball Courts. We received 2 bids with the low bid of $33,700 
being submitted by Sport Court St. Louis.  
 
We are required to clean and resurface our Premier Court Surfacing every 5 
years in order to maintain our warranty. In addition to cleaning and painting 
new tennis court lines we are also going to add shadow pickleball lines.  
Pickleball has become extremely popular in town and we have portable nets 
at the Huckleberry Courts that are used frequently for general play as well as 
large tournaments.  
 
The project should take approximately 1 week to complete and the courts will 
be closed during that time period.  
 
The Parks Department recommends the low bid of $33,700 from Sport 
Court St. Louis for the cleaning and resurfacing of the Huckleberry Park 
Tennis/Pickleball Courts.  
 
 
       
 
 



Parks and Recreation 
Andrew Dorian 
Director of Parks & Recreation 
City of Hannibal 
320 Broadway 
Hannibal, MO 63401 
Ph: 573 221-0154   Fax: 573 221-0155 
Email:  adorian@hannibal-mo.gov 
 
  
TO: City Clerk, City Manager, City Council and Mayor 
 
FROM: Andrew Dorian 
 
DATE:  04/09/2019   
 
RE:  Amendment to Deed of Conservation Easement  
 
Early in January of 2017 the City purchased two parcels of land, 
approximately 1.25 acres, located at the corner of Patchen and St. John’s 
Street adjacent to the Sodalis Nature Preserve. The Conservation Fund agreed 
to reimburse the city for the purchase of this land as long as the City agreed to 
include it in the same Conservation Easement as the Sodalis Nature Preserve.  
 
The Parks Department would like to amend the original “Deed of 
Conservation Easement” to include this approximately 1.25 acre tract of land 
(Tract 2). The amendment to the easement will allow the City to protect and 
preserve this second tract of land by subjecting it to the same easement on 
tract 1and binds the City and all future owners in perpetuity.  
 
Included with this memo and resolution is the contract amendment, legal 
description, maps and overview of the original Deed of Conservation 
Easement, including permitted and restricted uses. 
 
The Parks Department recommends the amendment to the original deed 
of conservation easement with the Iowa Natural Heritage Foundation 
which includes the 185 acre Sodalis Nature Preserve (Tract 1). The 
amendment will add two parcels that are approximately 1.25 acres (Tract 
2) that was purchased in 2017 to the original agreement and bind it by 
the same permitted uses and restrictions.  



Hannibal Fire Department 
Office of Deputy Fire Chief Ryan Neisen 
2333 Palmyra Road  Hannibal, MO  63401 

Phone:  573 221-0657  Fax: 573 221-2431  E-Mail: rneisen@hannibalfire.com 

MEMORANDUM 
 
To: Mayor Hark and Members of the City Council 
 
From:  Deputy Chief Ryan Neisen 
 
Re:  Missouri Department of Public Safety Grant Application and Subsequent Award Documents 
 
Date:  4-5-19 
 
 
 
The Hannibal Fire Department is planning to apply for a grant through the Missouri Department of Public 
Safety and State Homeland Security Program.   We are applying to replace four (4) gas monitoring devices 
on our Hazmat Trailer at a cost of $11,650.32.  There would be no cost to the City of Hannibal for this grant, 
as we are requesting 100 percent, no match funding.   Per grant procedure, we will receive 3 quotes prior to 
purchase.   
 
According to the grant application, the Authorized Official is defined as “the individual who has the 
authority to legally bind the applicant into a contract”.  In order for the Fire Department to apply for the grant 
and subsequent acceptance documents, the Council must approve, authorizing the Mayor to execute the 
necessary documents. 
 
A resolution and grant is attached for your information. 
 
 
 

 

 

 
 











 

                  
        
 
 

MEMORANDUM 
 
To:  Mayor and City Council   
 
From: Edie Price-DPW Management Assistant  
    
Re:  Old Baptist Cemetery Mowing 2019-20 
 
Date: April 10, 2019 
 

The Building Inspectors Office requested bids for the 2019-2020 Mowing of the Old Baptist 
Cemetery with a bid opening of April 10, 2019.   
 
Only one bid was submitted which was Simply Cut Laws with a total bid of $3,600.00.  
Simply Cut Lawns is who has been maintaining The Old Baptist Cemetery for The City over 
the past few years and has done an awesome just thus far.  The bid amount came in this 
year the same that it was last year, so this amount will not affect any line items in the 
budget.  
 
With Simply Cut Lawns being the only bidder, staff recommends award of the contract to 
Simply Cut Lawns.  
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  
 



 

                  
        
 
 

MEMORANDUM 
 
To:  Mayor and City Council   
 
From: Edie Price, DPW Management Assistant  
    
Re:  Consideration of 5-Year Capital Imp. Plan 2020-2024 
 
Date: April 1, 2019 
 

On March 28, 2019, the Planning and Zoning Commission received/reviewed the proposed Five-
Year Capital Improvement Plan covering years 2020-2024.  The Commission unanimously 
approved the plan, and recommends it be considered for vote by the City Council.  There is a 
cover memo inside the plan further explaining its methodology and contents.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  
 



 
 

 
 

MEMORANDUM 
 
To: Mayor and City Council  
 
From: Edie Price DPW (Jeff LaGarce, City Manager) 
 
Re: Ordinance Amending Chapter 32–Zoning Relative to Medical Marijuana Facilities 
 
Date: April 1, 2019 
 

Amendment 2 was approved by Missouri voters on November 6, 2018.  Amendment 2 modifies 
the Missouri Constitution by creating a new Section 1 of Article XVI, making to lawful under 
certain conditions to manufacture, cultivate, dispense, transport, prescribe, and use marijuana for 
medical purposes.  Pursuant to Amendment 2, these activities will be strictly governed, licensed, 
overseen, and enforced by the Missouri Department of Health and Senior Services. 
 
Amendment 2 allows state-licensed physicians to recommend marijuana to Qualifying Patients 
with certain medical conditions.  Per Amendment 2, prescriptions can come in many forms:  
ointments, pills, infused-food, vapors, etc. 
 
Regardless of how one voted on Amendment 2, Missouri voters approved this amendment 66% to 
34%, and is now law.   Many Missouri cities are now amending their zoning codes to address 
medical marijuana facilities.  Why?  Because Amendment 2 makes clear cities cannot prohibit 
these uses through exclusionary zoning, nor enact ordinances making them “unduly burdensome”.  
Cities may enact ordinances that don’t conflict with Amendment 2, but restrictions are limited to 
matters of time, place, and manner.  Outlawing them is not an option. 
 
Amendment 2 defines four (4) types of medical marijuana facilities (and so does the zoning Bill): 
 

1. Medical marijuana dispensary – a retail store for qualifying patients 
2. Medical marijuana cultivation facility – grows the product 
3. Medical marijuana infused-products manufacturing facility – processes the product 
4. Medical marijuana testing facility – tests the product 

 
Since the ability of medical marijuana facilities to locate here is a foregone conclusion, it is 
important for the city to create Permitted Use categories, where appropriate.  Restated, it behooves 
the city to identify an appropriate zoning district for each Use; otherwise they may end-up in 
locations where they’re not appropriate. 
 

 



Industrial Historic
AMENDMENT 2 DEFINED USES A B C D E E-1 F H-1
Medical Marijuana Dispensary
Medical Marijuana Cultivation Facility
Medical Marijuana Infused-Products Manuf. Facility
Medical Marijuana Testing Facility

CommercialResidential
Zoning Districts

PRESCRIBED USE BREAKDOWNS FOR EACH TYPE OF AMENDMENT 2 USE

Medical Marijuana Dispensary 
In-order to purchase product from a dispensary, Qualifying Patients or Caregivers (both are legal 
terms from Amendment 2) must possess a valid ID Card issued by the Missouri Department of 
Health and Senor Services.  As a Use group, dispensaries bear close resemblance to pharmacies.  
Use factors like (i) customer and vehicular traffic, (ii) shipments and delivery patterns, (iii) sales 
occurring internal to the building, (iv) lighting, (v) noise, (vi) trash pickup, (vii) operating hours, 
etc. should closely-resemble pharmacies.  Therefore, dispensaries are being included as Permitted 
Uses in the C, D, E, E-1, and F Zoning districts as General Retail (identical to the zoning treatment 
of pharmacies).  Unlike pharmacies however, dispensaries are being excluded from the H-1 
Historic District.  Why?  The historic district is space-limited (only 4 blocks long); and largely 
comprised of tourist goods, services, and attractions.  A non-tourism Use like dispensaries would 
consume scarce retail space in the historic district, leaving less space for future attractions and 
themed shops.  In short, a dispensary is not the highest and best use in the historic district. 
 
Medical Marijuana Cultivation Facility 
While Amendment 2 allows cultivation facilities indoors and out, they are likely to be indoors, in 
industrial buildings.  Midwest weather plays some part, but the security provisions required by 
Amendment 2 make outdoor cultivation facilities difficult to contemplate.  Cultivation facilities 
are very similar to manufacturing and are therefore recommended for the F-Industrial district only; 
like any other type of factory.   Cultivation facilities in commercial districts would not constitute 
the highest and best use.  They would consume productive areas for retail growth.  Also, 
commercial corridors like McMasters aren’t conducive for industrial-style shipping activity. 
 
Medical Marijuana Infused-Products Manufacturing Facility 
By definition, this is manufacturing, and prescribed for the F-Industrial district only. 
 
Medical Marijuana Testing Facility 
Testing facilities include science and technology components.  Given the nature of lab work and 
need for suitable office space to collect and store data, testing facilities are being prescribed in the 
D-Highway Business district and above (which by-extension, also includes the E, E1, and F 
districts).  However, it would not include C-Local Business, nor the H1 Historic District.  This Use 
is being treated as commercial; similar to commercial office or medical labs. 
 
The zoning Bill prescribes Permitted Uses as shown below.  Green represents districts permitting 
a particular Use, while red represents districts excluded.  No residential districts are affected. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



This zoning Bill incorporates Amendment 2 definitions for each of the four (4) Uses directly into 
our zoning code, and each definition includes a 400 feet setback from churches, daycare centers, 
and schools.  Amendment 2 states: 
 

“Unless allowed by local government, no new medical marijuana cultivation 
facility, medical marijuana testing facility, medical marijuana dispensary facility, 
or medical marijuana infused-products manufacturing facility shall be initially 
sited within 1,000 feet of any then-existing elementary or secondary school, child 
day-care center, or church”. 

 
Why employ a 400 foot setback, rather than 1,000 feet?  These Amendment 2 businesses are now 
“baked” into the MO Constitution.  They are immune from the MO Legislature, they are subject 
to intense State regulation, and they aren’t going away.  Given this, a number of cities are viewing 
these Uses as new job opportunities for local citizens - legal job opportunities in manufacturing, 
retail, and lab/science work. 
 
The chart here illustrates how other cities are addressing setback provisions relative to schools, 
churches, and daycare centers.  This is all brand new - only a few 
cities have actually adopted anything thus far.  Figures in the chart 
represent either (i) what’s been adopted, or (ii) what’s being 
recommended to those particular Planning & Zoning Commissions 
and City Councils.  The chart isn’t selective data presentation.  I 
included every city I could identify who’s currently in-process of 
making amendments.  Several were identified only by contacting 
the medical marijuana trade association in St. Louis, to learn what 
other cities are doing.  I suspect there are additional cities 
deliberating these measures, but I cannot identify them, or what 
they’re recommending. 
 
In-context, a 1,000 foot setback spans the equivalent length of 3 
city blocks in downtown Hannibal.  1,000 feet represents the 
center-point of the 4th Street intersection to the center-point of the 
7th Street intersection, and so forth on down-the-line.  1,000 feet is 
a tremendous setback distance, and could needlessly “regulate” 30-
40 new quality jobs right-out of your community.  Why should 
those jobs instead go elsewhere (Monroe City, Palmyra, etc.)?  These jobs are perfectly legal, and 
will be subject to greater oversight and regulation that most businesses in Missouri. 
 
Antidotally, most people with whom I’ve spoken about Amendment 2 – which is a great many – 
opposed the ballot issue on November 6.  I understand the concern; I share it.  Yet, investors 
wishing to open any of these new Uses in Hannibal will bring new jobs and new investment to this 
community.  It behooves the city to treat these businesses similar to traditional business enterprises 
– and secure those new jobs and investment (Amendment 2 states you must treat them similar). 
 
I’ve included photos below of each use type (except testing facilities); provided by the medical 
marijuana trade association in St. Louis.  They depict what one might experience at each facility. 
 

City Setback
Brookfield *** None
Moberly 100           
Springfield 200           
Creve Coeur 300           
North Kansas City 300           
Hannibal - Proposed 400          
Kansas City 750           
Warrensburg 1,000       
Crestwood 1,000       
Note 1:  These are either adopted,
or currently being recommended
to P&Z Commissions in MO.

Note 2:  *** As applies to any other
buildign in the respective zoning
district.

Municipal Comps



Dispensary 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Cultivation Facility 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Infused Products Manufacturing Facility 
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