Meetings are open to the
public, however, if you would
like to view the meeting, you
may do so using the following
instructions:

City Council meetings will be
videotaped to be shown live on
the City of Hannibal YouTube
page.

the web browser

2. Type in City of Hannibal in
the “Search” bar and hit Enter
and hit the magnifying glass on
the right side of the search bar.
3. Click on “City of Hannibal”
or the city of Hannibal crest.

4. During the City Council
meeting, there will be a red

Thumbnail with the word “Live”

on il

3. Click on the Thumbnail to
watch the meeting.

6. The meeting may be viewed
on the website in its entirely
dafter the meeting.

City of Hannibal

OFFICIAL COUNCIL AGENDA

Tuesday May 2, 2023
Council Chambers
7:00 p.m.

ROLL CALL

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE
APPROVAL OF AGENDA

APPROVAL OF MINUTES
Regularly Scheduled Council Meeting — April 18, 2023
Closed Session Minutes- November 1, 2022
Closed Session Minutes- November 15, 2022
Closed Session Minutes- December 6, 2022
Closed Session Minutes- December 20, 2022
Closed Session Minutes- January 17, 2023
Closed Session Minutes- February 21, 2023
Closed Session Minutes- March 7, 2023

APPROVAL OF PAYROLL AND CLAIMS
Second Half- April 2023

JASON NOLAND — HANNIBAL HIGH SCHOOL
Re: Hannibal High School Graduation Ceremony
Street Closures for Graduation Ceremony



JEFF HARDOIN - 1021 CENTER STREET
Re: Citizens of Hannibal

DAVID W. RUBY - 62325 OAK HILL ROAD
Re: Use of Clemens Field

APRIL AZOTEA — HANNIBAL MO.
Re: Questions for City Council and Mayor

JIM VAN HOOSE - 1009 SIERRA STREET
Re: City Manager Monthly Report
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Witness my Hand and the Seal
Of the City of Hannibal. Done
This 18™ day of April 2023.

CERTIFICATION OF ELECTION
Results of the Municipal Election of
April 4,2023

For Council Member — Fifth Ward: Marion County Ralls County
Colin R. Welch 220 18
Write In 0 0
Total Votes 220 18

Declaring Colin R. Welch winner of the Fifth Ward Council seat.

For Council Member — Sixth Ward: Total
Jeffery A. Veach 339
Write In 0

Declaring Jeffery A. Veach winner of the Sixth Ward Council seat.



Proposition R

Shall the Citizens of Hannibal support the City of Hannibal’s Recyeling Program by
approving a recycling fee of $1.90 (One dollar and ninety cents) per month, said fee to be
charged on each utility bill issued by the City of Hannibal Board of Public Work for service
provided within the City Limits of Hannibal, Missouri with said recycling services to be
provided by a third party contractor, with preference granted to contractors providing
meaningful, productive employment for people with disabilities? If adopted, this fee shall
continue for a three-year period to begin May 1, 2023 and expire April 30, 2026.

Yes No
Marion County 1L 738

n 11

all tangibie personal prbperty retail sales of adult use marijuana sold in the City of
Hannibal, Missouri?

Yes No

Marion County 1,265 597
Ralls County 12 17
TOTAL VOTES 1,277 604

Showing a total vote of 1,881 for Proposition 1 for the City of Hannibal: 1,277- YES and 604 - NO
votes; declaring Proposition 1 having passed by 673 votes.



JAMES R. HARKK — MAYUKR
Re: Oath of Office
o 5" Ward Council Member — Colin Welch
o 6" Ward Council Member — Jeff Veach

Re: Approval of Appointment

Historic Development District Commission
Bob Yapp — appeintment for a term to expire May 2024

Andrew Wikstrom — appointment for a term to expire May 2028

Re: Renewal Professional Service Contract James Lemon Law Firm, LLC
(Resolution No. 2454-23, to follow)

rlannng ana £0ning COIIImniss101
Andrew Wikstrom — appointment for a term to expire June 2024

Re: Recommendation of Re-appointment
Planning and Zoning Commission

Barry Louderman— appointment for a term to expire June 2027

MARIA KUHNS —- HANNIBAL REGIONAL ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT COUNCIL
Re: Update on Proposed Hannibal Community Improvement District

MIKE MURPHY - BUILDING INSPECTOR
Re: Set Public Hearing, Tuesday June 6, 2023
Vacate portion Choteau Street



ANDY DORIAN, DIRECTOR - CENTRAL SERVICES
Re: Bid Award Approval, Annual Street Materials

Aggregates - No Bid Received
Snow Removal Salt — Compass Minerals - $103.42
Snow Removal Salt - Cargill Inc. $108.38/ton
Asphalt - Emery Sapp & Sons - $§84.00
Diamond Asphalt - $90.00
Cold Patch - Diamond Asphalt - $140.00
Liquid Calcium Chloride — SICALCO - $.89/gallon
CLSM (Flowable Fill) — Bleigh Ready Mix -
$117.00/$40.00per hour
Eastern Missouri Concrete - $109.50/$40.00/ per hour
Gasoline and Diesel Fuel - Big River Oil
Concrete - Bleigh Ready Mix - $136.55/$40.00per hour
Mark Twain Ready Mix - $135.00/$40.00 per

hanr

BILL NO. 23-010

AN ORDINANCE REVISING CHAPTER 2 OF THE REVISED
ORDINANCES OF
THE CITY OF HANNIBAL BY REVOKING AND ENACTING IN IT’S
PLACE A NEW CHAPTER 2, ARTICLE III - CITY COUNCIL,
DIVISION 2, RULES AND ORDER OF BUSINESS, SECTION 2-172

First Reading
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CITY PROSECUTOR

CLOSED SESSION
In Accordance with RSMo. 610.021 (1), and (3)

ADJOURNMENT
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SPECIAL EVENT APPLICATION

(Council Meetings are the 1% & 3™ Tuesdays of each month)
Deadline for Submission: Wednesday, Prior to Council Meeting
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Fire:

No issue with this event.

Dept. Cost: 0

-Chief Ryan Neisen

Public Works: N/A

Dept. Cost: O

-N/A

Building Inspector:

| have no comment.

Dept. Cost: 0

-Mike Murphy

v/Rac'd 04 25 2023-BKD



parks: Parks has no objections. Dept. Cost: 0
-Andy Dorian

street; Streets has no objections. Dept. Cost: O
-Andy Dorian

No comments. Dept. Cost: 0

Tourism:

-Megan Rapp

Administration: Approval upon receipt of Certificate of Insurance. Dept. Cost: 0
-Clerk's Office

STAFF RECOMMENDS:

v'Rec'd 04.25 2023-BKD



vRec'd 0425 2023-8KD

automobiles and other vehicles used by Sponsor with a combined single iimit of $1,U00,U0U minimum,
Workers Compensation insurance with statuterily limits required by any applicable Federal or state law and
Employers Liability insurance with minimum limit of $1,000,000 per accident.

3) All policies of insurance must be on a primary basis, non-contributory with any other insurance and/or self-
insurance carried by the City.



I PURPOSE

A. This emergency action plan predetermines actions to take before and during the event in response
to an emergency or otherwise hazardous condition. These actions will be taken by organizers,
management, personnel, and attendees. These actions represent those required prior to the event

~ FLNRRNES S PR |

il ASSUMPTIONS

The possibility of an occurrence of an emergency is present at this event, The types of emergencies possible are
various and could require the response of Fire & Rescue, Emergency Medical Services, and Police.

V. BASIC PLAN

A. EAP Event Representative

The EAP event representative will be identified as the point of contact for all communications
regarding the event. This person is identified as:

|

- 2 | i/
Primary Contact: Qc‘?m’\  lolang

Cell Phone: %’?2'"7!‘% - Caéﬁgf

V'Rec'd 04 25 2023-BKD



B. Emergency Notification

1. Inthe event of an emergency, notification of the emergency will be through 911. The caller
should have the following information available to give to the 911 dispatcher: nature of the
emergency, location and contact person with callback number.

2. Will on—sight;MS be provided?

es No
[}

If yes, contact name and phone

representative will evaluate tne Conaitions ana UeLerimime it 1S SVEIL WL LSIHANE Juiisuu e
The EAP event representative or his/her designee will be identified as such and will be
responsible to monitor the weather conditions before and during the event.

3. During the event — If severe weather occurs during the event, the EAP event representative
or his/her designee will make the notification to those attending the event that a hazardous
weather condition exists and direct them to shelter.

4. There are limited provisions for sheltering participants in the event of severe weather.

D. Fire

4, SN0UIC an INCIOENU UCLUL LIdL IEHUITTD LT 1 16 LU pUL LTSy e e s
have the following information available to give the 911 dispatcher: Nature of the

emergency, location, and contact person with a callback number.

v Rec'd 04.25 2023-BKD




E. Maedical Emergencies

1. As with any event, there is a potential for injury to the participants. The types of injuries are
various and include those that are heat-related as well as traumatic injuries

2. Are there limited provisions for on-site Emergency Medical Services at this event?
-
YesDNo

3. Should an incident occur that requires Emergency Medical Services, contact as indicated to
this this resource. The caller will have the following information ready: Nature of emergency,
precise location and contact person with callback number

DOn-site EMS officer or lz@ﬁl Dispatch

F. Law Enforcement

1 Has a need for constant Law Enforcement presence been identified at this event?

Eén-site Security orDQH Dispatch for Law Enforcement

G. Emergency Vehicle Access

1. Access to emergency vehicles will be maintained at all times.

Vi, EVENT AREA MAP (attach next page)

'Rec'd 04.252023-BKD



City Council Request to Speak
Council Meetings are held the First and Third Tuesday of Each Month
Deadline is 4:00 p.m. Thursday prior to City Council Meeting
Speakers Must Reg:ster Using Current Residential Address &
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Phone Number: (-9/6) Lo0 —780|

Subject Matter: C : 5( u zens 0 { (—' Qamq; loql

mcogdal@hanhibal—mé.gov




Phone Number: S D72 - 890D 2295
Subject Matter: 7,7 Pefercnce 10 pse ot [ lemens (el
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Date Speaker’s Signature”

Speakers shall be allowed up to a maximum of a (5) minute presentation.
Speakers shall adhere to the above stated subject matter.

“Deadlines subject to change based on holiday schedule, etc.,” contact the
Clerk’s office for official deadline relating to the specific meeting.
(573)221.0111

City of Hannibal 320 Broadway, Hannibal, MO 63401
P 573.221.0111 F 573.221.8191

www.hannibal-mo.gov
mcogdal@hannibal-mo.gov
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Date Speaker’s Signatlre

Speakers shall be allowed up to a maximum of a (§) minute presentation.
Speakers shall adhere to the above stated subject matter.

“Deadlines subject to change based on holiday schedule, etc.,” contact the
Clerk’s office for official deadline relating to the specific meeting.
(573)221.0111

City of Hannibal 320 Broadway, Hannibal, MO 63401
P 573.221.0111 F 573.221.8191
www.hannibal-mo.gov
mcogdal@hannibal-mo.gov




City Council Request to Speak
Council Meetings are held the First and Third Tuesday of Each Month
Deadline is 4:00 p.m. Thursday prior to City Council Meeting
Speakers Must Register Using Current Residential Address &
Residing Ward (if applicable)

Today’s Date: 04/21/2023

Phone Number: 573-822-3828
Subject Matter: City Manager Monthly Report
04/21/2023 = (/dw )\}&{ﬂpu
Date ( fpeaker’s Signature

Speakers shall be allowed up to a maximum of a (5) minute presentation.
Speakers shall adhere to the above stated subject matter.

“Deadlines subject to change based on holiday schedule, etc.,” contact the
Clerk’s office for official deadline relating to the specific meeting.
(573)221.0111

City of Hannibal 320 Broadway, Hannibal, MO 63401
P 573.221.0111 F573.221.8191
www.hannibal-mo.gov
mcoadal@hannibal-mo.aov
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SERVICES AS CITY ATTORNEY AND CITY PROSECUTOR

WHEREAS, the City of Hannibal intends to enter into an agreement for the services of
City Attorney and City Prosecutor, and

WHEREAS, the Lemon Law Firm, LLC has agreed to provide this service and has
offered to provide such services beginning July 1, 2023 through June 30, 2026, with terms as set
out in the attached contract.

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY OF HANNIBAL,

DAL LAVZLY LYY W7 LLILD INCDUILULIULL DLIALL UNLDULIIY WLAVOLL VY LWL Y WRWILL L6D G/ R/ Y L

and adoption.

ADOPTED this day of » 2023
APPROVED this day of , 2023
JAMES HARK

MAYOR, CITY OF HANNIBAL, MO

City Clerk



CITY ATTORNEY
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES CONTRACT

This contract made and executed this ___ day of , 2023 by and between the City of
Hannibal, Missouri a municipal corporation, hereafter referred to as the “City” and the Lemon
Law Firm, LLC, Attorneys at Law, hereafter referred to as the “Attorney’s”, both agree to the
following:

RECITALS

The City desires to appoint James F. Lemon as City Attorney for the City of Hannibal,
Missouri and obtain the legal advice, counseling and services of the Lemon Law Firm,
LLC.

James F. Lemon desires to perform the services of City Attorney for the City of
Hannibal.

The City desires to appoint Ethan Matchett as City Prosecutor for the City of Hannibal

111C 1l Ly ALLUI'IIC)/, LlpUIl 1115 LClll[JUl.'d..ly AUSCLIVC 1LLUL1L LT HICTLLIED dllll ULULITD, 1>
authorized and empowered to designate as Acting City Attorney some attorney, duly
licensed by the State of Missouri, to appear for said attorney on his behalf.

AGREEMENT

Section 1: General

A,

The City hereby appoints James F. Lemon as City Attorney for the City of Hannibal,
Missouri to perform the functions and duties of City Attorney and Ethan Matchett as City
Prosecutor for the City of Hannibal, to perform the functions and duties of City
Prosecutor as specified in Chapter 10 of the City Charter attached hereto by reference and
made a part hereof as if more fully set forth herein. This appointment shall be effective
throughout the term of this agreement, unless cancelled or amended pursuant to this
agreement.

For the purpose of making legal services more readily available to the City, or in the
absence of James F. Lemon or Ethan Matchett, any other attorney who is licensed in the
State of Missouri, who is a member or employee of the Lemon Law Firm, LLC may
appear for or on behalf of the City or otherwise fulfill the functions and duties of City
Attomey as specified in Section 10.03 of the Hannibal City Charter, but in no such
instance shall the cost to the City be more than had James F. Lemon or Ethan Matchett
appeared on the City’s behalf or performed the function or duty of City Attorney
personally.

Pursuant to the base contract amount set out herein, the Attorneys shall provide legal



services requested by the City Manager and/or the Council to represent the City, the City
Council and the various departments and employees of the City in the following matters:

1, The City Attorney shall attend all meetings of the City Council, and all
regular meetings of The Board of Public Works.. The City Attorney shall
provide legal advice upon request at all such meetings.

2. During the period of time of 8:00 A.M. to 5:00 P.M., Monday-Friday, the City
Attorney shall provide legal counsel and advice to the Council, the City
Manager, the City Clerk, Department Heads, and such employees as may be
designated by the Council or City Manager, the Board of Public Works, the
BPW General Manager, BPW Department Heads, and such other employees
as may be designated by the BPW General Manager. Such legal counsel
shall include general legal advice, review and drafting of contracts, documents
and agreements, review and drafting of ordinances and resolutions as
requested by the Council and City manager, and legal research as requested

dss0C1dLe 101 CUVeILage.

3. At the request of the Council, the City Manager, the City Clerk, Department
Heads, and such employees as may be designated by the Council or City
Manager, the Board of Public Works, the BPW General Manager, BPW
Denartment Heads. and such other emplovees as mav be designated bv the

4. The City Prosecutor shall maintain and conduct the City Prosecutor’s office,
shall represent the City in all bench tried criminal trials, whether in City Court
or Associate Circuit Court. The City Prosecutor shall make all required filings
with the court for municipal criminal trials, correspond with Defendants and
Defense Counsel as necessary, and keep such records as are required under
the law.

D. Upon the agreement and mutual consent of the parties hereto, the City attorney may also
at the request of the City Council or the Board of Public Works provide the
following legal services at an hourly rate of $125.00 per hour billed in tenths of an
hour:

1. The City attorney may represent the City in Circuit Court regarding petitions
filed against the City, petitions filed by the City against a third party, and



generally, any civil matter agreed to by the City and the City attorney.

2. The City attorney may represent the City in regard to unemployment matters,
including any appeals of unemployment determinations for employees of the
City of Hannibal.

3. The City Prosecutor may represent the City in any criminal trials in City Court
in which the Defendant has requested a jury trial, which therefore require trial
in State Court.

4. The City attorney may represent the City in mediation or arbitration regarding
any matter filed either by the City against a third party or against the City by a
third party in Civil Court.

5. The City attorney may attend such other meetings as requested by the City
Manager, the City Council, The BPW Superintendent or the BPW Board.

1ne LIty agrees 10 pay s5ald AILOITIEYS 10T tNEIr SCIvICes OIl dIl dillludl Ddsls 01 dYU,UUU.UU.
Payments will be made on a monthly basis.

The City further agrees to pay an office allowance for secretarial, postage, etc on an annual basis
of $18,000.00 Payments will be made on a monthly basis.

Section 3: Termination of Contract

The contract period for this Contract shall commence on July 1, 2023 and continue through June
30, 2026. The contract shall automatically extend in one year increments thereafter, unless
modified or cancelled.  The City or City Attorney may terminate this contract at any time,



JAIWVIED ', LEIVIWIN TVJIN, JALVIED T1TADRND
LEMON LAw FirMm, LLC MAYOR, CITY OF HANNIBAL, MO

ETHAN MATCHETT Attest
LEMON LAW FIRM, LLC




MEMORANDUM

To: Melissa Cogdal - Deputy City Clerk
From: Lisa Peck - City Manager

Re:  Planning and Zoning



LU IVIEND>d WUBUdI, DEPULY LILY CIEl K
From: Maria Kuhns, Hannibal Regional Economic Development Council

Subject: Speaking Request for May 2™ Council Agenda
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Hannibal Regional Economic Development Council

NNE. { [V RN |



INTEROFFICE MEMORANDUM

TO: CITY COUNCIL

An application has been received from David Snyder to vacate a portion of
Choteau Street. The portion is located between 1420 Valley and 1424
Valley.

The Planning and Zoning Commission held their public hearing on Thursday,
April 20, 2023, at 4:00 P.M. The Department of Public Works is requesting
Council to set their public hearing date for Tuesday, June 6, 2023 at 6:15
P.M.



From: Andy Dorian, Director of Central Services

Re: Approval of Annual Materials

[ o W Avawzl E "IN

Snow Removal Salt SD-2023/24-2

Two Bidders

Compass Minerals $103.42 per ton charge (5-7 day delivery)
Cargill Salt $108.38 per ton charge (3-5-day delivery)
[tem Company 2022/23

Salt Compass Minerals $97.38

Salt Cargill Salt $102.17

Two bids were received this year for rock salt, Compass Minerals and Cargill Salt. Since both
amounts are close in price, we recommend accepting both bid amounts, in the event there isa
bad winter and we are not able to get salt from one company, we would have the option to use

the other company.



Asphalt SD 2023/24-3

Two Bidders
Emery Sapp & Sons Missouri (Pavememt) $84.00 Per Ton
Missouri (Base) $84.00 Per Ton
Illinois (Binder) No Bid
[llinois (Surface) No Bid
Diamond Asphalt Missouri (Pavement) No Bid
Missouri (Base) No Bid
[llinois (Binder) $90.00 Per Ton
[llinois (Surface) $90.00 Per Ton
Item Bidder 2022/23
Asphalt Emery Sapp & Sons $75.50 (Missouri - Pavement)
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is not mixing, we can use the other plant.

Cold Patch SD 2023/24-4
Two Bidders

Diamond Asphalt Missouri All Season Summer No Bid
Missouri All Season Winter No Bid
Missouri UPM No Bid
[llinois All Season M48-02 No Bid
Illinois All Season M120-05 $140.00

Emery Sapp & Sons Missouri All Season Summer No Bid
Missouri All Season Winter No Bid
Missouri UPM $145.00
[linois All Season M48-02 No Bid
Illinois All Season M120-05 No Bid

Item Bidder 2022/23

Cold Patch Diamond Asphalt (IL) $150.00

Emery Sapp & Sons (MO)  $140.00
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One Bidder

SICALCO $.89/gallon
Item Bidder 2022/23
Liquid Calcium SICALCO $.89

The City received one bid this year for the Liquid Calcium Chloride. The only bid received was
from SICALCO. There was no increase in price, we recommend accepting the bid from

1WO0 plaaers

Bleigh Ready Mix $128.50 with $40.00 demurrage charge after one hour.
Eastern Missouri Concrete ~ $120.00

(Mark Twain Ready Mix)

Item Bidder 2022/23

CLSM Bleigh Ready Mix $117.00/$40.00per hour

Mark Twain Ready Mix $109.50/$40.00 per hour

Single Bidder was B1g Kiver U1l

Fuel Items 2022/23 2023/2024
No Lead Gasoline $3.499 $3.09
No Lead Premium $4.099 $3.69

49 Miacal L4 909 $3.39



The City is recommending to accept the one bid from Big River Oil for gasoline and diesel fuel.

Concrete SD 2022/23-8

Two Bidders
Pavement Class B Demmurage

Eastern Missouri Concrete (Cubic Yard) — $142.00 $139.00
(Mark Twain Ready Mix)
Bleigh Ready Mix (Cubic Yard) $148.10 $146.50 $40.00
[tem Bidder 2021/22
Concrete Mark Twain Ready Mix  $135.00/$40.00 per hour

Bleigh Ready Mix $136.55 (Pavement)  $135 (Class B)/$40.00 per hr

Thank you for your time.



5-7 days

Indicate telephone number to be called for placing orders:

9900 W 109th St., Overland Park, KS 66210
Address

800-323-1641
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BID NO. 5D-2023/24-2

BID SCHEDULE

(NOTE: Bids shall include any applicable taxes or fees.)

ITEM UNIT UNIT PRICE DELIVERED

Snow Removal Salt Ton $ 108.38/per ton

Indicate approximate delivery time by your firm upon receipt of order from the City:

3-5 Business Days

BYi Cargill Incorporated, Sait - Road Safety
Company Name

Dby 4

{) Signature

Shelly Brown - Customer Care Representalive
Typed Name & Title

Seal if by corporation:

24950 Couniry Club Bivd Ste 450, North Olmsted OH, 44070

Address

800-600-7258 4/5/2023
Telephone Date
ATTEST:



ASPHALI
BID SCHEDULE FOR FISCAL YEAR 2023/2024

ITEM: ASPHALT NIT PRICE
Missouri:
Plant Mix Bituminous Pavement, Type BP-1 or BP-2 Ton $ g4 00
Plant Mix Bituminous Base Course Ton $ %900
Hlinois:
HMA Binder, IL-19.0, N50 Ton $ oo B
Seal if by Corporation Frer) Sapp ¢ sons, Int
" Firm
f: . (ot Y3p
Address

/’Aﬁnn!ﬁ(x Mﬁ Q}(/U/

ﬁ‘w. [ 2023 573 405956
Date Telephone

ATTEST:

/),ﬂe/rx/xw ‘Uil &

i Aature Date




ASPHALT

BID SCHEDULE FOR FISCAL YEAR 2023/2024

ITEM: ASPHALT
Missouri:
Plant Mix Bituminous Pavement, Type BP-1 or BP-2

Plant Mix Bituminous Base Course

fllinois:
HMA Binder, IL-19.0, N50

Seal if by Corporation

UNIT PRICE
Ton s NO DID
Ton $ NO BID
Ton $ 90.00

BY: ;ﬂ,’ﬁ@f—*

Signature

Chad Keppner

Typed Name

Diamond Construction Company

Firm
2000 North 18th, PO Box 3486

Address

~oo - FAaAAE



BID NO. SD-2022/23-4
COLD PATCH

BID SCHEDULE FOR FISCAL YEAR 2023/2024

[TEM: COLD PATCH UNI PRICE
Missouri: All Season or Pre-Mix (Summer Grade) Ton $ No Bid

All Season or Pre-Mix (Winter Grade) Ton $_ No Bid

UPM High Performance Ton $_No mid

BY: AW s %—»7?/]//"

~  Signature

Chad Keppner

Typed Name

Diamond Construction Company

Firm

2000 North 18th, PO Box 3486

Address
Quincy, IL 62305

ATTEST:

4/3/2023 (217) 222-3532

Nata Talanhnna



BID NO. SD-2022/23-4
COLD PATCH

BID SCHEDULE FOR FISCAL YEAR 2023/2024

ITEM: COLD PATCH UNIT PRICE
Missouri; All Season or Pre-Mix (Summer Grade) Ton $ ilo Gid
All Season or Pre-Mix (Winter Grade) Ton $ Mo Gid
UPM High Performance Ton $_ [45.
swp) ' )

BY: ,c/%’é* [ —

Signature

ﬂ?elkf ﬁr’pﬁ

" Typed Name

ATTEST:

Barit 12 %23

573~ 21} 5958

"Date

a’/%ﬁ\/m.%/ ;//}{/zz
ale

Siﬁﬁ’ature

Telephone



BID NO. SD-2023/24-5
Fiscal Year July 1, 2023 to June 30, 2024

BID FORM
[TEM UNIT UNIT PRICE DELIVERED
Liquid Caleium Chloride Gallon s O 'xo'

Bids shall include any applicable taxes or fees.

Indicate approximate delivery time by your firm upon receipt of Order from the City:

” {2,.-' Eps nn.‘a

BY: ZA i iﬁé_,’ ;%
Signature

Frawk .. STes T&
Typed Name & Title

SECANLCO, LT

Firm Name
522 W Chestnuy ST

Addre% H:\‘Tﬁ G‘ ‘3

Friwsdale , P GO5 4|
/ 23 382 U~ZC5 4
Date Telephone

ATTEST:

Signature



Fiscal Year 2023/2024 (July 1, 2023 through June 30, 2024).

It is understood that quantities are, at this time, undetermined, and that the successful bidder shall
furnish and deliver any and all that the City might require. Proposal shall be based upon deliveries

during the bidder's regular working days or other others by special arrangements. Access to job site
chall he nrnvided hv the Citv of Hannihal
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BIDDER: 17}\0:%/\/\ Qﬂ&ﬁtk.(f MmN

TRISHA R O'CHELTREE



CLSM - FLOWABLE FILL

If this Bid is accepted, the undersigned agrees to furnish and deliver Controlled Low-Strength
Material at the unit price quoted, upon notification from the City Engineer or his designate to a site
as specified by the City Engineer or his designate. It is understood that this bid shall be effective for

e 4 AnAA L AN ANA

D el T

No liability shall accrue against bidder by reasons of delays caused by labor difficulties, fire,
accidents, delays of carrier, or for any other cause beyond bidder's control, including all present and
future Government rulings which may affect shipment, production, or manufacture of any material
herein mentioned.

NASIN LN L sl s o0 7 LN FY TR L AN I NN L AL AYAL XN L A ANAL ML/ yona b prpsssnnnissasisnanany w : SRR

(CLSM - Flowable Fill)
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ATTEST:

DATE: Y- )3- 2023







BID PROPOSAL FORM (con't.)
BID NO. SD-2022/23-8

CONCRETE

2023/2024
BID
Per Cubic Yard:
PAVEMENT CONCRETE .....vevvveevervesssesasessssssssesssseseces 3 /42
(furnished as needed)
Mileage Charge Outside City Limiits........cocoviiiniiiinniiiin. 8 —_
Denurrage Charge.....ociveeieetsrinriiiiinincne. $
Demurrage Charge.....ooiveviriiierieiiniiniioiinn, $

BIDDER: /N Rex Twhiw Ready )y

SEAL, if by Corporation BY: fg/m A N et



BID PROPOSAL FORM (con't.)
BID NO. SD-2022/23-8

CONCRETE

BID

Per Cubic Yard,

PAVEMENT CONCRETE ...covvvininnns

(furnished as needed)

Mileage Charge Outside City Limits

Demurrage Charge...c.ccceisivisrsisesanie

Demurrage Charge.....cccvvviveinsnrrecnnas

SEAL, if by Corporation

TRISHA R O'CHELTREE
Notary Public - Notary Seal

2023/2024

S5 ] e
.............................. oo /I YIS
............................... $ HOWo / Hr {)L {owJ

BIDDER: B\D;Q{S\/\ ’RJ)(‘.(-Jk[ I/Y\.‘\f
BY: %Y:r»,l%z ¢ KP\\Q%V\
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Asphalt SD 2023/24-3
Two Bidders

Emery Sapp & Sons

Missouri (Pavememt)
Missouri (Base)
Illinois (Binder)
Illinois (Surface)

Diamond Asphalt Missouri (Pavement)
Missouri (Base)
[llinois (Binder)
[llinois (Surface)

Item Bidder 2022/23

Asphalt Emery Sapp & Sons

$84.00 Per Ton
$84.00 Per Ton
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
$90.00 Per Ton
$90.00 Per Ton

$75.50 (Missouri - Pavement)

companies, which will benelt me LIty 10 nave DOL COMPAres VIl SILIUDY L1 LIE CVELLL VLT praiit
is not mixing, we can use the other plant.

Cold Patch SD 2023/24-4

Two Bidders

Diamond Asphalt

Emery Sapp & Sons

Missouri All Season Summer
Missouri All Season Winter
Missouri UPM

I[linois All Season M48-02
Ilinois All Season M120-05

Missouri All Season Summer
Missouri All Season Winter
Missouri UPM

[linois All Season M48-02
[linois All Season M120-05

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$140.00

No Bid
No Bid
$145.00
No Bid
No Bid



Two bids were received this year for our Cold Patch bid, Emery Sapp & Sons and Diamond
Construction. The City would like to accept the low bid from Emery Sapp & Sons for the fiscal

year 2023/24.

Liquid Calcium Chloride SD 2023/24-5

One Bidder
SICALCO $.89/gallon
Ttem Bidder 2022/23

iIwe Brdaders

Bleigh Ready Mix $128.50 with $40.00 demurrage charge after one hour.
Eastern Missouri Concrete  $120.00

(Mark Twain Ready Mix)

Item Bidder 2022/23

CLSM Bleigh Ready Mix $117.00/$40.00per hour

Mark Twain Ready Mix $109.50/$40.00 per hour



The City is recommending to accept the one bid from Big River Oil for gasoline and diesel fuel.

Concrete SD 2022/23-8
Two Bidders

Pavement Class B - Demmurage
Eastern Missouri Concrete (Cubic Yard) — $142.00 $139.00
(Mark Twain Ready Mix)
Bleigh Ready Mix (Cubic Yard) $148.10 $146.50 $40.00
Item Bidder 2021/22
Concrete Mark Twain Ready Mix ~ $135.00/$40.00 per hour
Bleigh Ready Mix $136.55 (Pavement)  $135 (Class B)/$40.00 per hr

Thank you for your time.



MEMO
Proposal to Promote Accountability and Transparency with

Monthly City Manager’s Report

TO: Hannibal City Council

For the 7th time in 7 meetings, we are asking Council to update the ordinances to require a
monthly report from the City Manager to our citizens and businesses in our Public Council
Meetings.

As members of City Council, we work for our citizens who elects us. Our citizens would be
better able to offer feedback on our performance if they received a monthly update on the
happenings in Hannibal’s Government. The City Manager Reports would create a better-
informed City Council. A better-informed City Council should result in an even more effective

working relationship with the City Manager in achieving the goals we as a Council ought to be
setting for the City in response to the feedback from the citizens.

First reading to follow.

FROM:
Charles Phillips, Councilperson for Hannibal’s 4th Ward

Stephan Franke, Councilperson for Hannibal’s 3rd Ward



BILL NO. 23-010 ORDINANCE NO.

FIRST READING 05.02.2023 SECOND READING

AN ORDINANCE REVISING CHAPTER 2 OF THE REVISED ORDINANCES OF
THE CITY OF HANNIBAL BY REVOKING AND ENACTING IN IT’S PLACE A NEW
CHAPTER 2, ARTICLE III - CITY COUNCIL, DIVISION 2, RULES AND ORDER OF

BUSINESS, SECTION 2-172

Be it Ordained by the City Council of the City of Hannibal:

Section 1. WHEREAS, the City Council has determined that in order to encourage

Louncil oI e LIty OI Hannipal;

NOW THEREFORE, the City Council makes the following amendments to Chapter 2 of the
ordinances of the City of Hannibal:

Section 2. CHAPTER 2, ARTICLE III — City Council, Division 2, Rules and Order of
Business, Section 2-172 is hereby revoked and replaced as follows:

Sec. 2-172. - Order of business; call to order.

At the hour appointed for the meeting, the clerk or someone appointed to serve in his absence
shall proceed to call the roll of members, marking the absentees, and announce whether a
quorum is present. Upon the appearance of the quorum, the council shall be called to order by
the mayor, if present. If the mayor is absent, the meeting shall be called to order by the mayor
pro tempore. If both are absent, the council shall elect a temporary chairman. The council may
then proceed to do the business before it. The order of business shall be as follows:

(1) Roll call.
(2) Call to order.

(3) Invocation.



(4) City Manager’s Report (note the City Managers Report shall be made only during the second
meeting of the month unless the City Manager has additional matters which they believe need to

be presented at the first meeting.)

(5) Financial reports.

(6) Mayoral appointments, council approvals thereof, and resignations.
(7) Miscellaneous business.

(8) Resolutions and ordinances.

unlawful or unconstitutional, the remaining parts, portions and sub-portions shall be and remain
in full force and effect.

Section 5. All ordinances and parts of ordinances in conflict with this ordinance, in so far as
they conflict, are hereby repealed.

Section 6. That this Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage and
approval.

Adopted this ___ day of , 2023.

Approved this ___ day of 52023,

James Hark, Mayor

Melissa Cogdal, Deputy City Clerk



Request for Update

We would like an update on City Council’s October 18th, 2022 directive to staff to update the
towing ordinances to establish the proper protocol for which towing company is called when
one is needed. On that date representatives from various local towing companies came to
Council to express their concern over what they perceived to be “Unfair Towing Practice(s)”

The example used to illustrate their frustration was when a volunteer firefighter called Heartland
Towing onto the scene of an accident when it was Scott’s Minor Collision and Towing’s turn in
the rotation.

After hearing their concerns, Council decided to address the towing situation when we voted,
“to form a committee including City Attorney Lemon, City Manager Peck, and Police and Fire
Chiefs to draft (an) Ordinance and return back to Council in a month.”

In a recent post on Facebook, a public forum, City Councilperson and Mayor Pro Tem Mike
Dobson explained,

AUVIDTU WY DLl VI LT WU VLTI GARAUL LD ST LARL S i Al Y manangs e nnoaea R T

best to leave well enough alone”. The decision as to how to address the conE:érns of those
towing companies contacted should be a decision of the full Council after being fully briefed
by Staff.

FROM:
Charles Phillips, Councilperson for Hannibal’s 4th Ward

Stephan Franke, Councilperson for Hannibal’s 3rd Ward



