
 
City of Hannibal 

 
OFFICIAL COUNCIL AGENDA 

 
 

Tuesday May 17, 2022 
Council Chambers 

7:00 p.m. 
 
 
 

ROLL CALL 
 
 

CALL TO ORDER 
 
 

INVOCATION 
 
 

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 
 
 

APPROVAL OF AGENDA 
 
 

APPROVAL OF MINUTES 
Regularly Scheduled Council Meeting – May 3, 2022 

 
 

APPROVAL OF PAYROLL AND CLAIMS 
              First Half – May 2022 

 
 
 

JIM CONIGLIO - HHS CROSS COUNTRY 
Re:  Request, Street Closures – Pirate Pride 5K 

Saturday, June 11, 2022- 9:00 am- 11:00 am 
 

MELISSA CUMMINS- MARK TWAIN MUSEUM 
Re:  Request, Street Closures – Music Under The Stars 
Thursdays June 2- August 25, 2022- 5:00 pm- 9:15 pm 

 
COREY MEHAFFY- MRRPA 



Re: Funding for MRRPA Development 
 
 

JACOB W. NACKE 
Re: Purchase of Portable Radios, Extended Warranties, Batteries and Chargers 

A&W Communications, $10,746.18 
 
 

MEGAN RAPP – DIRECTOR, HCVB 
 Re: PMF Grant Application-Matching Marketing Funds 

Convention Visitors Bureau- $120,000 
 
 

MIKE MURPHY – BUILDING INSPECTOR 
Re: Timber View Terrace Subdivision 

(Bill No. 22-13, to follow) 
 

ANDY DORIAN, DIRECTOR – CENTRAL SERVICES 
 

Re: Drum Mulcher Bid Award 
Woody's Municipal Supply Company- $32,985 

 
Re: Approval of Annual Materials 

Various  
 

Re: Land Conservation Partnership Grant Agreement 
Missouri Department of Conservation- $100, 000   

(Resolution No. 2410-22 , to follow) 
 

Re: 1906 Irwin Lot Purchase 
Shawn and Billie Frick  

                           (Resolution No. 2411-22 , to follow) 
 
 

JAMES LEMON – CITY ATTORNEY 
Re: Acquisition of Right of Way 

Missouri Department of Transportation- Highway 79 Overpass 
 

        Re: Amendment of Proposed Franchise Agreement  
Midstates Gas Company   

(Bill No. 22-006 , to follow) 
 
 
 

RESOLUTION NO. 2410-22 
 



A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF HANNIBAL AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR TO 
SIGN A LAND CONSERVATION PARTNERSHIP GRANT AGREEMENT IN ORDER 
TO RECEIVE $100, 000 FOR THE CONSTRUCTION OF A NATURE PAVILION AT 

THE SODALIS NATURE PRESERVE.  
 

RESOLUTION NO. 2411-22 
 

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF HANNIBAL AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR TO 
EXECUTE A SECOND SPECIAL WARRANTY DEED TO SHAWN FRICK AND 

BILLIE FRICK FOR THE SALE OF CITY OWNED PROPERTY LOCATED AT 1906 
IRWIN ADDING THE OMITTED LEGAL DESCRIPTION FROM THE ORIGINAL 

WARRANTY DEED.  
 
 

BILL NO. 22-013 
 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF HANNIBAL APPROVING AND ACCEPTING 
THE FINAL PART OF THE TIMBER VIEW TERRACE SUBDIVISION BEING PART 

OF THE WEST HALF OF THE WEST HALF OF SECTION 24, TOWNSHIP 57 
NORTH, RANGE 5 WEST OF THE FIFTH PRINCIPAL MERIDIAN, MARION 

COUNTY, MISSOURI.  
 

First Reading 
 
 

BILL NO. 22-006 
 

AN ORDINANCE GRANTING A FRANCHISE BY THE CITY OF HANNIBAL, 
COUNTY OF MARION, MISSOURI, TO LIBERTY UTILITIES (MIDSTATES 

NATURAL GAS) CORP. DBA LIBERTY UTILITIES OR LIBERTY, ITS SUCCESSORS 
AND ASSIGNS, THE RIGHT TO FURNISH, SELL AND DISTRIBUTE GAS TO THE 

CITY AND TO ALL PERSONS, BUSINESSES AND INDUSTRIES WITHIN THE CITY 
AND THE RIGHT TO ACQUIRE, CONSTRUCT, INSTALL, LOCATE, MAINTAIN, 

OPERATE AND EXTEND INTO, WITHIN AND THROUGH SAID CITY ALL 
FACILITIES REASONABLY NECESSARY TO FURNISH, SELL AND DISTRIBUTE 

GAS TO THE CITY AND TO ALL PERSONS, BUSINESSES AND INDUSTRIES 
WITHIN THE CITY AND IN THE TERRITORY ADJACENT THERETO AND THE 
RIGHT TO MAKE REASONABLE USE OF ALL STREETS AND OTHER PUBLIC 

PLACES AS MAY BE NECESSARY, AND FIXING THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS 
THEREOF. 

 
 Second Reading, as amended  

 
 
 
 



CLOSED SESSION 
In Accordance with RSMo. 610.021 (3) 

 
 

ADJOURNMENT 













































 

                  
        
 
 

MEMORANDUM 
 
To:  Mayor and City Council   
 
From: Andy Dorian, Director of Central Services 
    
Re:  Approval of Annual Materials  
 
Date: May 10, 2022 
 

On Thursday, May 5, 2022 the Hannibal Street Department went out for bids on our Annual 
Materials.  The Bid Tabulations are on the attached sheets, but I would like to give a price 
breakdown for each bid and any changes from our bids last year. 
 
Aggregates SD-2022/23-1 
Single Bidder was Central Stone 
 
Item     2021/22   2022/23 
Type 1 or 2 Flex Base   $9.15    $9.60 
Commercial Flex Base  $9.15    $9.60 
1-1/2 Surfacing   $9.50    $10.15 
½” Bituminous Surface  $15.50    $16.15  
3/8” Seal Coat    $15.50    $16.30 
Granular Fill     $5.20    $5.45 
Quarry Run     $9.55    $10.05 
1” Resurfacing   $10.25    $10.75 
Rip Rap    $19.00    $19.95 
3/8 Seal Coat (gravel)   $16.00    $16.75 
Concrete Sand    $8.95    $9.50 
Manufactured Sand   $12.60    $13.25 
CA 16 ¼” Washed Chips  $15.50    $17.50 
3” Oversized Rock    $9.70    $11.25 
1 Inch Clean     $12.55    $13.35 
 
Rock prices have increased on almost every line item from last year, this will have an impact on 
our budget for the upcoming year.  We are recommending accepting the one bid from Central 
Stone for fiscal yar 2022/23.    
 



Snow Removal Salt SD-2022/23-2 
Two Bidders 
 
Compass Minerals  $  97.38 per ton charge (5-7 day delivery) 
Cargill Salt    $102.17 per ton charge (3-5 day delivery)  
 
 
Item   Company    2021/22 2022/2023 
Salt   Compass Minerals  $89.20  $ 97.38 
Salt  Cargill Salt    $96.47  $102.17 
 
 
Two bids were received this year for rock salt, Compass Minerals and Cargill Salt.  Since both 
amounts are close in price, we are recommending accepting both bid amounts, in the event there 
is a bad winter and we are not able to get salt from one company, we would have the option to 
use the other company.   
 
 
Asphalt SD 2022/23-3 
Two Bidders 
 
Emery Sapp & Sons  Missouri (Pavememt)   $75.50 Per Ton  
    Missouri (Base)   $74.00 Per Ton 
    Illinois (Binder)   $76.80 Per Ton 

Illinois (Surface)   $79.60 Per Ton 
 

Diamond Asphalt   Missouri (Pavement)   No Bid  
    Missouri (Base)   No Bid 
    Illinois (Binder)   $95.00 Per Ton 
    Illinois (Surface)   $95.00 Per Ton 
 
 
Item   Bidder    2021/22  
Asphalt  Emery Sapp & Sons  $62.00 (Missouri)   
  Diamond Asphalt  $65.00 (Illinois) 
 
Two bids were received this year for our asphalt bid, Emery Sapp & Sons and Diamond Asphalt.  
We are recommending Council to accept the bids from both companies, which will benefit the 
City to have both companies on standby in the event one plant is not mixing, we can use the 
other plant.    
 
 
 
 
 
 



Cold Patch SD 2022/23-4 
Two Bidders 
 
Emery Sapp & Sons  Missouri All Season Summer   No Bid  
    Missouri All Season Winter   No Bid 
    Missouri UPM     $140.00 
    Illinois All Season M48-02   No Bid 
    Illinois All Season M120-05   No Bid  
 
Diamond Asphalt   Missouri All Season Summer   No Bid  
    Missouri All Season Winter   No Bid 
    Missouri UPM     No Bid 
    Illinois All Season M48-02   No Bid 
    Illinois All Season M120-05   $150.00 
 
 
Item    Bidder    2021/22  2022/23 
Cold Patch  Emery Sapp & Sons (MO) $135.00  $140.00 
   Diamond Asphalt (IL)  $115.00  $150.00 
  
Two bids were received this year for our Cold Patch bid, Emery Sapp & Sons and Diamond 
Construction.  The City would like to accept the low bid from Emery Sapp & Sons for the fiscal 
year 2022/23.  
 
 
Liquid Calcium Chloride SD 2022/23-5 
One Bidder  
 
SICALCO    $.89/gallon 
 
Item   Bidder   2021/22 2022/23 
Liquid Calcium  SICALCO  $.86  $.89 
 
 
The City received one bid this year for the Liquid Calcium Chloride.  The only bid received was 
from SICALCO.  With a slight increase in price, we are recommending accepting the bid from 
SICALCO in the amount of $.89/gallon. We have used this company over the past few years and 
have been very pleased with their product.  
 
 
CLSM (Flowable Fill) SD 2022/23-6 
Two Bidders 
 
Bleigh Ready Mix   $117.00 with $40.00 demurrage charge after one hour. 
Mark Twain Ready Mix  $109.50 with $40.00 demurrage charge after one hour. 
 



Item  Bidder     2021/22    2022/23 
CLSM  Bleigh Ready Mix  $92.50/$40.00 per hour      $117.00/$40.00per hour 
  Mark Twain Ready Mix $96.50/$40.00 per hour      $109.50/$40.00 per hour 
 
 
We received two bids this year for CLSM (flowable fill), Bleigh Ready Mix and Mark Twain 
Redi Mix.  We are recommending accepting both bids for the fiscal yar 2022/23.    
 
 
Gasoline and Diesel Fuel SD 2022/23-7 
Single Bidder was Big River Oil 
 
Fuel Items    2021/22  2022/23 
No Lead Gasoline  $2.73   $3.499 
No Lead Premium   $3.23   $4.099 
#2 Diesel    $2.93   $4.999 
Winter Blend Diesel   $2.93   $4.999 
Off Road Diesel   $2.61   $4.299 
Boat Harbor    $2.81   $3.579 
 
The City is recommending to accept the one bid from Big River Oil for gasoline and diesel fuel.  
 
 
Concrete SD 2022/23-8 
Two Bidders 
      Pavement  Class B Demmurage  
Bleigh Ready Mix (Cubic Yard)  $136.55  $135.00 $40.00  
Mark Twain Ready Mix (Cubic Yard) $135.00  $135.00 $40.00   
 
Item  Bidder     2021/22    
Concrete Bleigh Ready Mix          $125.00/$40.00 per hour       
  Mark Twain Ready Mix      $122.00/$40.00 per hour      
 
The City is recommending to accept both bids, while giving Mark Twain Redi Mix the first 
opportunity for purchase as the low bidder.  Both companies will be used by the City on 
upcoming projects and will be beneficial to have both companies on standby in case one plant is 
not up and running we can use the other.  
 
 
Thank you for your time.  
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