BILL NO. 24-008 ORDINANCE NO. 4956
AS AMENDED

FIRST READING 02.20.2024 SECOND READING 03.05.2024

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 7, BUILDINGS AND BUILDING

REGULATIONS OF THE REVISED ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF HANNIBAL BY

AMENDED ARTICLE I, DIVISION 1, SECTION 7-25 BUILDING CODE, BY
ADOPTING THE 2018 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE IN PLACE OF THE 2012
INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE

Be it Ordained by the City Council of the City of Hannibal:

Section 1. WHEREAS, a review of the Ordinances of the City of Hannibal shows that the
City of Hannibal has adopted various international building codes as ordinances of the city of
Hannibal,;

AND WHEREAS, the City of Hannibal had previously adopted the 2012
International Fire Code;

AND WHEREAS, the Planning and Zoning Commission in conjunction with the
Hannibal Fire Department and the Office of the Building Inspector has reviewed said 2012
International Fire Code, as well as the more recently drafted 2018 International Fire Code and
has determined that it is necessary to adopt the said 2018 International Fire Code, and has
recommended same to the City Council;

AND WHEREAS, the City Council has further reviewed the matter and the
proposed revisions as well as the recommendation of the Planning and Zoning Commission and
have determined that the revisions are appropriate and in the best interests of the City of
Hannibal

NOW THEREFORE, the City Council hereby revises Chapter 7 as follows:
Section 2. Section 7-25 is revoked and a new section 7-25 is hereby enacted as follows:

Sec. 7-25. - Building code.

(a) Codes adopted. The following documents, along with all their appendices, if any, a copy of
which shall be on file in the office of the building inspector, and at the Hannibal Free Public
Library, hereby adopted as the building code of the City of Hannibal:

(1) The 2012 International Building Code;
(2) The 2018 International Fire Code;
(3) The 2012 International Residential Code;




(4) The 2012 Plumbing Code;

(5) The 2006 International Private Sewage Disposal Code;
(6) The 2012 International Mechanical Code;

(7) The 2012 International Fuel Gas Code;

(8) The 2006 International Energy Conservation Code;

(9) The 2006 International Property Maintenance Code;
(10) The 2005 NFPA National Electrical Code.

(b) Amendments. The codes adopted in subsection (a) are hereby amended in the following
respects:

i. The Property Maintenance Code: PM-106.6, Exemption. There is expressly exempt
from section 106.6, Transfer of Ownership, the Small Business Administration—Disaster
Assistance Loan Program.

ii. The 2018 International Fire Code: Excepting the following:
1103.5.1 Fire Sprinklers in Existing Group A 2 Occupancies
3106 Outdoor Assembly Events

Appendix L Fire Fighter Air Replacement Systems

Section 3. All ordinances and parts of ordinances in conflict with this ordinance, in so far as
they conflict, are hereby repealed.

Section 4. That this Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage and
approval.

Adopted this 5 day of AN 2024

Approved this 5 day of maﬁm 2024, /7 %/L

r L derman, Mayor

ATTEST:

e >

Melissa Cogdal, City Clerk




Changes from 2012-2015 International Fire Code

Cide Reference Change Type Change Summary

312.3 Vehicle Impact Protection Addition This change authorizes the code official to approve barriers other than posts.

%5-5. 605.12 Storage and Abandoned Addition This change prohibits storage in air-handling plenums. Abandoned material and wiring cables must be remaved from plenums.

iring in Plenums

403 Emergency Preparedness Medification This section has been extensively revised and the content updated for consistency. To assist the fire code official, many portions of this

Requirements chapter have been relocated in an attempt to consolidate into one section all of the requirements for emergency preparedness,

604.1 Emergency and Standby Power Addition This change brings additional requirements related to emergency and standby power systems from the IBC into the IFC to provide for

Systems consistency and uniform enforcement. Load-transfer timing and duration are both quantified to assist the fire code official. Criteria have
been added for Group 1-2 occupancies that are located in flood hazard areas.

604.2.6, IBC 407,10 Emergency and Addition Essential electrical systems must comply with IBC Chapter 27 and NFPA 99. This change provides a clear path for the designer to know

Standby Power Systems - Group 1-2 which standards apply when he or she is designing an essential electrical system for a Group -2 occupancy.

Occupancies

605.11 Sclar PhotovoltaicPower Systems | Clarification The requirements for solar PV sysiems have been clarified and coordinated with the IBC and NFPC 70.

606.12 Pressure Relief Devices for Meodification he revisions to Section 606.12 clarify the code requirements and add references to two Intemational institute of Ammonia Refrigeration

mechanical Refrigeration (IIAR) standards and one American Society of Heating, Refrigerating and Air-Conditioning Engineers, Inc. (ASHRAE) standard for design
and operation of ammonia refrigeration systems.

6017.6 Protection of Fire Service Access Addition This is a new requirement to ensure that devices designed to prevent water from infiitrating into fire service access elevator hoistways

Elevators and Occupant Evacuation and occupant evacuatian elevator hoistways are properly maintained.

Elevators

6008.2 Commercial Cooking Appliances Madification Type | exhaust hoods are not required over electric cooking appliances when the appliances produce a minimal amount of grease-laden

Producing a Low Volume of Grease-laden vapors.

Vapors

608.3.3.2 Inspection and Cleaning of Modificatian This section references a new standard that addresses the cleaning of commercial cooking exhaust hoods and ducts.

Commerical Kitchen Exhaust Hoods

609.4 Gas-fired Appliance Connections Addition Listed flexible connectors are required between the fixed fuel-gas piping and cooking appliances on casters or other appliances that are
moved for cleaning.

611 Hyperbaric Facilities Addition A new Section 611 on hyperbaric facilities has been added to the IFC. According to the provisions of this section, these facilities shall be
inspected, tested and maintained in accordance with NFPA 99. Records shall be kept and made available to the fire code official.

807 Decorative Materials Other Than Modification The requirements for decorative materials other than decorative vegetation have been reorganized and clarified.

Decorative Vegetation in New and Existing

Buildings

901.4.1 Regired Fire Protection Systems  |Clarification The code has been clarified concerning how an inspector can determine if a fire protection system is to be considered a “required”
system or a “nonrequired” system.

901.8.2 Remaval of Existing Occupant Use |Addition Existing T%-inch hose lines can be removed under certain circumstances.

Hese Line

903.2.1 Fire Sprinklers in Group A Modification When fire sprinklers are required in a Group A occupancy tocated on a story other than the level of exit discharge, fire sprinklers must be

Ogcupancies

installed on all stories leading to all levels of exit discharge that are used by the Group A occupancy.

S

903.2.1.6 Assembly Occupancies on Roofs

Addition

Fire sprinklers are now required on all floors between the occupied roof and the levef of exit discharge when assembly uses occur on the
rooftop of buildings and the occupant load exceeds 100 for Group A-2 or 300 for other Group A ogcupancies.

Mot Required When Automatic Fire
Defection System is Provided

503.2.1.7 Multiple Group A Fire Areas Modification When multiple Group A-1, A-2, A-3 or A-4 fire areas share egress paths, the occupant load will be combined for determining if a fire
sprinkier system is required. The occupant load threshold is 300 or more.

903.2.9 Commerical Motor Vehicles - Fire  |Clarificaticn This code change provides a specific definition for commercial motor vehicles, which is applicable when the fire code official is

Sprinkler Requirements determining whether a fire sprinkler system is required in specific occupancies.

903.2.11.2 Buildings 55 Feet or More in Clarification This section has been revised to clarify how the height of a building is to be measured and that the section applies to buildings that have

Height-_Sprinklers Required one or more stories. The exception for airport control towers has been deleted.

903.3.1.1.1 Exempt Locations- Sprinklers  |Modification This change introduces the concept of Machine Room-Less elevators (MRLS) to the IFC and provides correlation with ASME A17.1-

2007/CSA B44-07. In the 2012 code, sprinkler exemptions are currently provided for elevator machine rooms and machinery spaces. This
change expands the exemption to the control rooms and control spaces associated with occupant evacuation elevators. Additienally, the
code has been changed regarding area smoke detection and fire command center requirements to reflect the defining of elevator control
rooms and control spaces.




903.3.1.1.2 Bathrooms Exampt fiom

Addition

{ This new secfion provides crfreria fornot instaliing sprinklers in bathrooms of specific Group. R occupancies.

| Sprinkler Requiremerits

|903.3.1.2 NFF'A "18A Sprinkler System:

Clasthioation

.| This chiange comelates Graup R imitafions on h-gﬂt with thescope of. NFPA 13R:

leridet] corrider {breezewav} Anasgoviated change Is in Seciion 1027 6¥orexietiof stairways and-ramps. To correlate the open-ended

The intent of Section' 9133.3 T.2.2 isto clarify-that when an NFPA T3R sprinkfer systern is use;. additionsl Heads are required in the.open-

corridor:conceptin existing; hmldmgs with thesg changesr, Section 11D4.22 has been changed through the deletion of exception 7, which

jthange: providesaddimonal effterla regsrding ﬂrze use.of theSe systems. .

Thils change redpces e nleter of sprinkler heads that can hgrused b aimited area sprmkler systen from 20 heads o 6 heads, This

{This thangerecoghizes automafic watsr mist syszems az:analfernative,on-a imited b351s, To aumma‘ac fire sprinkler systems.

Automatm water mist systems ars. mest commonly used for:specish protection applications for special Hazard applications suchas

UL 300A Ties heenatded to the IFE, and the new definifion of instittional Oceupancy Group 2 Condition T {Nursing Homes, Assisted -
3 fram the (3G tor an exfingiishing-sysian within'the domestic conking hoodof such 'occupancy Hias heen ncorporated.

Minimum Audbility Level

908.3.4:2:2, 1027.6, T104:22 NEPAASR {Addition
Shrinkler Systems - Qpen-Ended Corridors
(Breezaways)

. . - Jaliows the-onen-ended corrider. criteris 10 diciate the salufion,
903.3.8 Limited Area Sprinkier Systems Madificaticn
904.2, 804.11 AufomaticWater Mist Addificn
Systems

toomputerroom subfloors and machinery spaces.

804.13 Ddomestic Coaking Systems in Addftion
Group 1-2:Condition 1 Oceupancies - FEhiing,
807.1.2 Fire Alarm Shop Drawings - Delsgn | Addition

The fire:alarm designer Is/iow reqiived to provids the design maidimeiim audibiffty ievel for occupant notification, and the phrase “where
applicahle” hias-baen added to the charging statement to-clarify that notall items showsin the list may be applicabiefor every
Ingitsilaston.

907.2.3 Group E Manual Fire Alann-Systemny

Modification

The threshold Tor | reEUirng | a manuai fire alarm system has bean ralsed from 30-ncoupants fo 50. The emergency voice/alarm
communicationsystem fequiirement has bigen raised-to 100 pocupants:

Thechangeto SUZ.2.6 Exceptron % links the use 0f "private ricde™ mgﬂafmg under-NFPA 72 1o the fire salaty and evacuation plan
reqiiramierits of Chiapter 4.:58ctior 507,521 has beenrevised th dltow s use of aprivate mode audible alaym n critical care
argas. Section 907.5.2:% Has beeh revised- to.allow for the substituiion of an avdible alarm fora visual alar in oritical vare areas.

Systesini for Group R College-and - Universify

907.2.6, 907.5.2.1, 007.52.3 Fire Alarm.  [Clarification
and Detestion: Systems for Goruo 1-2

Condifion 2 Oceupancies )
907.2,9.3 Fire Alamm and Defection Clarification

The addition of the language "occlipanties operated by & cbllsge oruniversity for siudent orstaff iousing” isintended to clarify this
section and the regifirement Yo autpifiatic smoke detection.

807.2.11.3,:907 2. 1.4 Smoke:Alarms near
Cooking Appharces and Bathroonis

Addition

This new secfion provides degigners, plén exarniners and.fiéld inspectors:withcriteria for locating simoke alarms in-refation-to cooking
applisnces and bathrooms. By, propeshifocating smicke alanns; the number of nuisanés darms may be redused, .

907.2.11.7 Smoks Deteciion Syston

Addifion

This new secfionprovides an op’cton for using a smoke detection system in fedof single-stalion and multinie-stafion alarms in-Groups B
2,53, Redand -1

807.2.14 Fire Alanm and Deteciion Systems
for Atfiums

Clarification

‘This change clasifies that smoke deiecﬁon in atdums is to be pased-on the: Tational’ anafysrs preseribed in Section 960.4 and that g generie
sonrlfernent for iriétaliation.of sriake détection s not nbeessariy wartanted:

907.2.22.1, 907.2.22.2 Smake Dateclion for
Aigpart Traffic Control Towers

Addition

This paw section provides speelfle citeria regarding smoke deténtqr’-lmaﬁuns in airporttraffic onr_atro!'tovirers. Adifferent eriterion is
used deperiditie ot whether ornot the alrpor! teaffie confrol tower s single or multiple exits andif iis:spiinklered.

Chapter 10 Means of Egress

909.4.7 Bmoke Contral System Interaction |Addifion This néw section:reqidres tha anzlysis ‘of multipe mechsnical smoke contre] systems. Bufldings Using smoke cortrol systems may have
: more than one tyne of smoke cortrol sysiém, and The frteractions of these systemns mustheevaliated in the design.
9009.6.3 Smoke Conirol Systems - |Aadition 1 This-section has-bearradded Tor.clarification:of the responsitility and authority between the fire code official-and the building official In
Fressurized Staiways and Elevator ralation to stiake contrGl Systemis.
Heistways
B09.12.1, 509.20.6 Vertications o " |Modiication This modificationzllows the fire coda official the discretion to bypass individual ccmpanerﬁs fropvthe weekly preprogrammed smoke
Mechanical Smioke:Conirol-Sysfenis. control verdficatitn Tesiing, Tt fiither requirestesting of all bypasseﬂ‘comgenents anaseiilannual basis,
808.21 Elevator Holstway Pressirization [Addition This change provides thesoption of presstirizing. the elevator Hoisiway 1 Bet of enclosing the elevator Iobby. The ertire-section has been
Altemiztive atided fothe IFC o féciitate coofdiiation befivéen code officials. Additiomatiy, four exceptons have bicen-added to the pressurization
t resuirements that ih effect provide ati allemative way for the.smuoke conbral svsiom o bedesigned:
810 Smoke-and Heat Removal Modification ‘Thifs section hias been exterisively rewtitten asa résult of the work donetiy the Gode Teshndlogy Committes-and specifically the Roof
Vet Study Greup. I provides:direcion o Group, F-% ang $1 occupenties greater than 56,000 square fect of andivided area and high-
. piled combustible storade. Criteriz for using eithersmoke and-heatvenisor mechanical smicke removal are provided.
918.2.2 Eleciric Girouits Supplying Fire Adtlition This new provision: references Ul Stendard 2195, which prowides for survivability of fire pimp power-supply witing.
Pamps
215 Carben Monoxide Detection Modification The requircments for carboh maoxide: detecﬂon have besn comple:teiy PrT— clarfy the grovisions, Telocated to:a new Section 915,
e - [antt expandad to adiiress classiooms it Group £ goeugangies.
{Modification Fhechapterhias been refonmatied with the provisions for'egréess r:qmrements from a space or story belng consolidated into 2

| e Secoir 1006-and a new Section 1007,




1004.7.7 Cumutative: Occlpant Loads Mpdification The determinztion of the ctimelaiive design oceupantlead for infervening spaces, adjacent levels and-adjacent stories has been clarified
and combined Into'a single‘setion: A subsectich has been added to address egréss fromeadjacent storigs to cfarify that the nurmiber of
cccupants frim adjacent storiss: are-not added together enfess there Is a convergence of egress-at an intermediate lavel by cecupants
teaving& story fropy above snd helow that poimt, .

Table 1004.1.2 Occupant | oad Factors: . [Modification Thischanyé has revised the marcanliie: occupant load factarand crested one factorfor all ficors,

1008, 1007 Numbers of Bxits'and Exit Modificafion ' Thls modification has consclidetedithe etress requiremants for roamsand siiagés along with'those-for stories Into. & $ingle Jocaion. it

Agcass Docnways hagdlso crested.a stgie sectidn fo deal with the number of exits {Section 1066} and aseparate. section {Section 1367} 1o deat withthe

. arrangerient and sEparation reanirerents

1007.1 Exit and Exit Access Doorway Iniodification Thig seetion riow provides specific informidiion regarding the paint where exrt separauon is'te be-measured. Where three or more means

Configuration of etresy ave required. e tode restores nerformance lanquane toensure the sgr 5 are adsauataly sephrited.

1008.8 Two-Way Cotarrunication JFClarfication This charige:clarifies iat 2 twoswayicommunication. system:may serve-rmultiple elevators and that the Systems afe not required at

i T Aservicerelevatorg freight elevators, orprivate residence elevators,
1010.1.89 Door Operations - Locking IModification Numerous revigions throughout thess locking. pmws:ons help clarify requirsments and theirapplication by usifg consistent terminology.
‘1Systems ‘1hese changes allow an existing lockingsystern exceptionfor migindoorsihat are niot located at The exterior of the: bmidmg

1G11.15, 1041.18 Ship Ladders:and Adeition This section has heen-added:to ist the: lacations where Tadders can, be:used Joracceiss Pemanent Jadders muist follow the consiruction

Ladders requitemients from the TG 1 order fo-provids consigtent” instaliation:and o safe’usable ladder.

16148 Handrail Projechons Meodification This section tiow provides guldance and srforceable langtisge $o-the building nificial can determine when a pair of intermediate
handrafls beging to-obiskuct e reqiitred eqgress widthof o stairway,: This helps to clarify when the width of the stair must be increased

. : due to the two intermediate handrailsreducing e available egfess width,
1G16.2 Egress through Intervering Spaces  [Modification This miodificgtion allews necugant-egress through an slevator lobby provided aceesss 1o atleast oneexit is avai Tiable without the
] ) oceugant passing ihrotdh the lobiby, iraddresses the extent of ‘the reguired elevetor lobby protection.

1017.2.2 Travel Distanca Increase for Modification This: modtﬁcatlan Allowsan Hicrensed exit soésss travel distance-within Gioup. F-1 of S+t occupancies meeting. speciﬁc requiraments.

Group F-1-and 8-1 Qocupancies Also,it restores. s fravel distance that was-allowed in'thie 2006 code bist hot allgwiad In'the:2009:0r 2077 editions.

10083, 1018.5. Aisles Rodification ‘The reqaired width of aistes in Gioups B and b Um&panmes aswell.ag aisles in othier otoupancies are now tied to the widths required

. __ for corrldots and fotfist fo the capacity has thie oce L
[1870.2 Comder Width-aned Capacity Clarification Anew exception helps to-clarifythe wrdth reqmremen’;s for'corridors wuhm Group -2 occupancias for areas where bed or stretcher
- movernent is Not nedessaiy. .
1023.3.1 Stalrway Extension Modification An interids exit stairway. is how permitted To continue directly into an exit passageway without the need for a fire door assembiy to
. Iegparate helwo Blements.

1625.13.2.2.1 Stepped Alsle Construction Modification This new:section limits the variationallowed between adjacent rigsers within @ stepped aisie. The previcus code did not limit the variation

Tolerances forihess fsers.

1183.4.1 Vertica Openings in Existing Medification etroactive com: conrstruction of a 1-heur fireresistancerated separation s now required-in-existiag haspl:ta!s and jajis 1o protact vertical

Group -2 and'1-3 Ceoupancies ‘foperings. Alterrativeshave Besn includerd that can Be-used in fieu of e separation to mifigdtetie hazard created by the vertical
ODEHLHES

1103.7.6 Manual Fire Alarm System in Medification The ingtaliation of interconected smoke alarms within dwelling urits a[nng \mth flreremstance—ra'ted separatlon of dweliing unlts is

Existing Croup R-2 Occuparicies |aliowed as an alternative to the retfoactiveinstallation of a mamual fire atarm system thraughartihe building in existing Group R2

lostupancies:

1105 Constiefion Requirements far Addition | Retrogstive canstwhon requxremerﬂshava hesn added 10 the [EC 1o provide:a minimum level for Hire-and life safety inexsting Group -2

Exisfing Group 12 Qecupanties ) oectpancies.

23074 [P-gas Dispensing Operations I lod®eation [P-gas requirernents have bean' Tevised o xmprove Correlation with. other industy standards and 1o allow self-service LP-gas refueling

| by the public.

3103.9.1 Structural Design-of Multistory Addition 1Temporary muftistory tenis and membrane structurss are now, requ:rad to.comply-with the: Structural ‘yequitaments in the IBC.

|Tents:and Membrans Bttuciures.

3105 Temporary Stage Canoples [Addition { Temporayy'stage Ganopies are now-pesnitted and regulated ﬂmfier' Chapter3t-and must have a:structurally. sound design.

3203:2 Class [ Commodiiies Modification & beilding centaining Glass eommiodifies sfored on plgstic pallets will now réquire-a fire sprinklsr system 1o be'designed based on

; ‘ the NEPA 13 sprfidércriteria; The dliowance to include'any sdlid-deck polysthylons pallets as sccenitable for Class T eommudiiies has

3206.4.1 Plesiic Pallets Used in High-plled (Modificstion [NEPA:13 provisions.args now refersnced 1o address fhe use of plastie pallets inhigh-piled combustible:storage. Plastic paliels’ tan affect the.

Cembusilnla Storage: classication of the cominodity. )

3206.9.3 Dead-end Alsles in High-piled. Cilarification Specific imitations arenow provided for dead-end aisles inhigh-plied combustible storage areas These limitstions are mors festrictive

‘Cembustible Storage _ than the common path of egressiravel imitafions due tohazards sssociated with high-niled combustible storate.

330622 Cleaning with-Flammable Gas JAddition. Safety requirements for the nirging and cleaning of Bammiable gas’pining systems have been added to the 2015 IEC,

13504.1.7, 3510 Het Work oo Flammable  [Addifion Reguirements-for hot work on‘lanks containing flammable and combisstible fiquids is row included inthe 2015 1FC.
and Combustitle Liquid Stotage Tanks ‘ .




Table 5003.1.1 Maximum Allowable Modification Table 5003.1.1(1) contains several revisions affecting consumer fireworks, combustible fibers, unstable reactive materials, alcohol-based
Quantities of Hazardous Material hand rubs and gas rooms.
5101.4, 5104 Plastic Aerosol Containers Modification Aerosol products are now allowed in plastic containers up to 33.8 fluid cunces, or 1 liter, in size. Specific product criteria must be met if

the plastic containers exceed 4 fluid ounces.

5307 Carbon Dioxide (CO 2) Systesm Used
in Beverage Dispensing Applications

Addition

Large refrigerated carbon dioxide systems create a life safety hazard. Regulation of these systems is now included in the 2015 IFC.

5704.2.9.7.3 Flame Aresters on Protected {Deletion Flame arresters or pressure-vacuum (PY) breather valves are no longer required on all protected above-ground storage tanks, only those
Above-Ground Storage Tanks containing Class | flamimable liguids.

5808 Hydrogen Fuel Gas Rooms Addition Requirements applicable to a hydrogen fuel gas reom have been included in the IFC, providing comrelation with industry standards.
Appendix B, B105 Fire-Flow Requirements [Modification Criteria have been added to Appendix B that specify the amount of reduction available for each type of fire sprinkier system and establish
for Buildings the methad for determining the minimum water supply requirement and duration based on the reduced fire-flow requirement.

Appendix C Fire Hydrant Locations and Madification The revisions to Appendix C provide refinement of the fire hydrant spacing requirements and add footnotes that increase hydrant spacing
Distribution based on the installation of an automatic sprinkler system.

Appendix K Construction Requirements for |Addition The new Appendix K addresses retroactive construction requirements for existing Ambulatery Care Facilities. The appendix

Existing Ambulatory Care Facilities reguirements are in addition to the retroactive construction requirements in |FC Chapter 11.

Appendix L Fire Fighter Air Replenishment |Addition This new appendix provides criteria for the design, installation and testing of Fire Fighter Air Replenishment Systems {FARS) for use
Systems during firefighting operations. DO NOT ADOPT THIS ONE - APPENDIX L

Appendix M Retroactive Installation of Fire  |Addition An atamatic fire sprinkler system is reguired to be retroactively installed in existing high-rise buildings.

Sprinklers in Existing High-Rise Buildings




Changes from 2015-2018 International Fire Code

Code Reference Change Type Change Summary

314.4 Indoor Display of Vehicles Modification This section is revised to clarify it applies to both liquid-fueled vehicles and gaseous-fueled vehicles. Additionally, it has been modified to
allow the Fire Code Official the ability to determine the best method of safeguarding the vehicle regarding the battery and electrical system.

315.3.1 Celling Clearance for Indoor Meodification Exceptions have been added which allow an increase in the height of storage along walls in sprinkiered and nansprinklered buildings.

Storage

315.1, 315.7, 105.6.28 Outdoor Pallet Addition Requirements are added to the code for height limitation and separation to buildings and property fines for the outdoor storage of idle pallets

Storage constructed of wood or plastic. See also Significant Change to Section 2810 for pallet storage at pallet recycling and manufacturing

403.12.3, 403.12.3.1 Crowd Managers Modification The threshold for crowd managers dropped from 1.000 to 500 people for certain events.

404.2.3, 404.2.3.1, 404.2.3.2, 404.2.3.3 Addition Updates and prescribes details for facility lockdown plans.

Lackdown Plans

510 Emergency Responder Radio Coverage

Modification

Requirements for emergency responder radio coverage have been revised to address industry and eguipment enhancements with a new
reference to NFPA 1221,

603.1, 603.3 Fuelfired Appliances Modification Fuel oil storage allowances in Section 603 have been revised to clarify applicability to intemal combustion engines, such as generators and
fire pumps. Fuel oil storage is increased to 1,320 gallons if the building is sprinklered and the tank is listed to UL 142.

605.13, 605.16, 605.17 Refrigerants with  |Addition Adds requirements regarding safety concems for lower flammability refrigerant gases.

Lower Flammability Hazards

608.3 Nonmetallic Cooking Oil Storage Modification Adds listing and capacity requirements for cooking oil storage.

Tanks

807.1, 807.2, 807.5 Combustible Medification The limitations on decorative combustible materials are clarified as to where they apply.

Decorative Materials

807.4 Artificial Decorative Vegetation Modification The limitafions on decorative combustible materials are clarified as to where they apply.

901.4.6.1, 901.4.6.2, 901.4.6.3, 901.4.6.4 |Additicn Additional requiremenis have been added for automatic sprinkier system riser rooms and fire pump rooms.

Fire Pump and Fire Sprinkler Riser Rooms

901.6.2 Integrated Fire Protection System  |Addition Test criteria has been added to the code with a reference to NFPA 4 to ensure that where multiple fire protection systems or life safety

Testing systemns are integrated, that the acceptance process and subsequent testing must evaluate all of the integrated systems as a whole.

901.8.2 Removal of Occupant- use Hose  |Modification Test criteria has been added to the code with a reference to NFPA 4 to ensure that where multiple fire protection systems or [ife safety

Lines

systems are integrated, that the acceplance process and subsequent testing must evaluate all of the integrated systems as a whole.

903.2.1 Sprinklers in Group A Occupancies

Clarification

Clarifies the requirements for fire sprinkler protection in Group A occupancies.

903.2.3 Sprinklers in Group E Occupancies

Modification

Provides occupant load threshold for automatic sprinkler system requirements in Group E occupancies.

903.3.1.1.2 Spriniders in Bathrooms in Modification Remaves fire sprinkier requirements from small bathrooms in Group R-4 occupancies.

Group R Occupancies

903.3.1.2.1 Sprinklers Beneath Balconies  |Modification Correlates automatic sprinkler system requirements in Chapter 9 with IBC Chapter 7 for exterior balconies of Group R occupancies.

903.3.1.2.3 Protection of Attics in Group R |Addition Sprinkler protection of acceptable altemative methods for the protection of altics are now addressed for mid-rise buildings housing

Occupancies muttifarnily occupancies and equipped with an NFPA 13R sprinkler system.

903.3.3 Sprinkler Obstructions Medification The code now directs the user to the sprinkler design standard to address sprinkler obstructions.

904.12 Commercial Cooking Operations Modification The installation of fire-extinguishing systems as protection for commercial cooking eperations must now comply with NFPA 88. [n addition,
commercial cooking systems are now permitted to be protecied with a water mist fire-extinguishing system.

904,13 Domestic Cooking in Institutional Modification Requires an automatic fire-extinguishing system to protect domestic cooking appliances in care facilities.

Occupancies

904.14, Table 901.6.1 Aerosol Fire- Addition Requires automatic fire suppression in domestic cocking systems in care faciiities.

extinguishing Systems

905.3.1 Class Il Standpipes Modification Standpipe systems are now required in buildings four or more stories in height. In addition, a Class | standpipe is allowed in Group B and
Group E occupancies rather than a Class I,

905.4 Class | Standpipe Hose Connections |Modification Allows a meodification of hese connection locations for Class 1 standpipes serving open stairways.

905.11 Locking Caps on Standpipe Outlets |Medification This revision authorizes the cods official to require locking caps on dry standpipe hose connection outlets.

906.1 Portable Fire Extinguishers Medification Provides schools options for fire extinguisher placement.

507.1.2 Fire Alarm Construction Modification Aligns requirements for fire alarm plans and documentaiion requirements with NFPA 72.

907.2.1 Fire Alarms in Group A Madification A new fire alarm threshold has been added for Group A occupancies where an occupant load of 100 or more is iocated on a level other than

Occupancies

the level of exit discharge.




1031.10 Inspection and Testing of
Emergency Egress Lighting

Modification

Inspection and testing requirements for emergency egress lighting are relocated into Chapter 10 Means of Egress and revised o allow self-
diagnostics.

1103.5.1 Fire Sprnklers in Exdisting Group A
2 Occoupancies

Additicn

A section has been added to Chapter 11 which requires the retrofit installation of a fire sprinkler system in existing Group A-2 occupancies
where alcocholic beverages are consumed if the occupant load is 300 or more. DO NOT ADOPT THIS ONE

1103.9 Carbon Monoxide Alarms in Existing
Buildings

Modification

Carbon monoxide alarms are no longer required to be retroactively installed in existing Groups 1-1, 1-2, -4, and R based on occupancy
classification. The retroactive installation of carbon monoxide alarms is only required in existing sleeping rooms and dwelling units.

1104.16.2 Wall Openings Adjacent to Fire | Modification Door and window openings within 10 fest of a fire escape must be protected with %-hour opening protectives uniess the building is

Escapes sprinklered.

1105.6.2 Fire-protection-rated Doors in Addition Fire-protection-rated doors in existing Group 1-2 cccupancies have three options for automatic closing operations.

Existing Group -2

Chapter 12 Energy Systems Addition This new chapter has been added to the IFC to address all configurations of energy systems. This chapter contalns the emergency power,
standby power, and siationary battery storage system requirements from Chapter 6 of the 2015 IFC along with new requirements for other
methods of energy generation and storage.

1204.5 Rapid Shutdown for Solar Addition Rapid shutdown is required on solar photovoltaic systems to reduce the shock hazard to emergency responders.

Photovoltaic Power Systems

1206.2 Stationary Storage Battery Systems |[Modification This revision moves the stationary battery storage system requirements from Section 608 to Section 1206.2 and includes new battery
technologies and required safety features.

Chapter 22 Combustible Dust Modification Reference to the new NFPA 852, “Standard on the Fundamentals of Combustible Dust,” is added to provide guidance and criteria when
evaluating combustible dust hazards.

2303,2.1 Height of Emergency Disconnect |Addition This new section provides speciic height limitations for emergency disconnect switches for fuel dispensing operations.

Swiltch

2306.7.3.1 Protection from Vehicle Impact {Addition The fire code official has the authority to require additional vehicle impact protection at fuel dispensing facilities.

2309.6, 2309.6.1 Defueling of Hydrogen Medification The requirements for repairing vehicles fueled by compressed or liquefied hydrogen gas have been updaled to address current tachnologies

Fugled Vehicles and processes.

2311.6 Repair of Vehicles Fueled by CNG | Addition The requirements for repairing vehicles fueled by compressed or liquefied natural gas have been updated to address current technologies

and LNG

and processes.

2311.8 Repair of Vehicles Fueled by Lighter-
than- air Fuels

Modification

The requirements for repaliring vehicles fueled by compressed or liquefied compressed gas have been updated to address current
technologies and processes.

2403.2.1.3 Classified Electrical Areas Modification The size of the classified area around spray booth openings is reduced to 3 feet.

Around Spray Boaths

2404.2, 2404.3.1, 914.9 Spray Rooms and |Modification Requirements far spray booths and spray operations are comelated between the IFC and the IBC.

Spray Booths

2810 Outdoor Storage of Pallets at Pallet | Addition This new section adds criteria for outdoor pallet storage at pallet manufacturing facilities and palist recycling facilities. It provides specific

Manufacturing and Recycling Facilifies height limits and separation to property lines and buildings, but also allows for the distances to be medified based on providing additional
fire protection features.

Chapter 31 Umbrella Structures Clarification A new definition is added for umbrelia siructures which results in regulation of umbrella structures when they exceed 400 square fesl.

3103.3.1 Tents and Membrane Structures | Addition Special amusement buildings located in temporary tents are required to be equipped with an automatic sprinkler system.

Used as Special Amusement Buildings

3103.6, 3103,9 Structural Stability of Tents |Modification Temporary tenis and membrane structures are required to provide construetion documents which address their structural stability and load
carrying capacity, Larger tents and membrane sfructures have been added o the list of temporary facilities which must comply.

3104.2 Fabrics for Tents and Membrane Addition The application of testing criteria for flame spread of tent and membrane structures has been clarified.

Structures

3105, 105.6.47, 105.7.22 Temporary Addition The requirements for temporary stage siructures are expanded to include all temporary structures greater than 400 square feet when used

Special Event Structures at special events.

3106 Outdoor Assembly Events Addition This section adds requirements specific to outdoor public gatherings and improves the comretation of requirements in the IBC and IFC. DO
NOT ADOPT THIS ONE

3107.13 LLP-gas Containers and Tanks Madification Requirements for the use and separation of LP-gas containers in and around tents and membrane structures have been revised.

Adjacent to Tents and Membrane

Chapter 32 High-piled Combustible Storage

Modification

The requirements in the chapler have been updated to correlate with current NFPA 13 requirements and recent FM Global fire tests.

3304.5, 3308, 3309.1 Fire Watch During  [Modification Criteria for requiring fire watch has been added to the code along with clarification to the functions and duties of the fire walch personnel.
Construction and Demolition
Chapter 38 Higher Education Laboratories  |Addition A new chapter has been added to the IFC to specifically regulate college and university laboratories. Correlating sections have been added

to a new Section 427 in the IBC.




Exhibhifons

Chapter 38 Processingand Exdraction Addition A niew chapter Nas been added to the IR0 fo specincally reguiate the process of extraciing cils from: plant malerial.

Fycilifies + . .

Table 5O03.1. 11y Consumer Fireworks Modifieation Addresses the explosive Tature of Division 1.4G explosives and removes fhe 100 percant mcresse N quUanity for Sprinkiers where these

itemsare stored.

5Q03.1.101), 5003.11.1, 6303.1.1.2 Modification | The'meimum allowablerquantity for Class 3 oxidizers is'increased by about 10 percent In corttrol aréas and Groups M and S ocoupancies

Maximtim Allowable Quantity for Class 3 .

Osidizers

5003.8.3.4 Construction of Confrol Areas | Modification TThe fire-resisiance rating of the TooT Of & CONrOI area i & Type 1V DUGIAG 15 aimwad fo be reduced 1 1-Hour iHe building is sprinkiered
_tand does nol extecd ihres stores o height.

5005.1.12 Protectioh of Hazardous Modification: Reguirements for lsakedetection and ermergancy shuteff for high hazard ‘gases and Jiquids only app!y whenthe mammum alowahle quarﬂ:ty

Magjerials Piping Systems - per control arca 1S exceedad.

5103.2, 5104.%.2 Aerosol Produsts in jModification Limitations:on‘aeroscl preducts i plastc contalners is-revised and the use of Plasfic Aercedl X preducts is prohikjited in-higher Iie hazard

Plastic Contairiers: [ . ooclipancies,

510322, 510422510433, 51048 |Addifion " |Specific:fire pmtect(on requiremesis e added to: address 6ros0l CCOKING Spray products.

5106.2.2 AerosolCooking: Spray Prodicts

5&% 1. 53062 Medical Gas Storage Modificaiion | Requirsments fr. consﬁucﬁbn;and ventilation of interior medical gas s and aas Cabinets are revised, :

53071, 53075 Eiguid-Garbon Dicide Modification |Requirements Torfiquefied GOz in beverage dispensing applications: haie been corelsted With fequirements for gis defection systems.

Systens for Beverage Dispensing . L )

53074 Carbon Dioxide: Ehrichment Addition Carbon dicdde ervichiment gysiams are now regulated by the Intemational Fire Code when the system confains mare than 108 pounds of

Systems C02, erwhenthe refil connection isTemots fom thetank of vessal.

5707 Mobile: Fue]mg Qperations |Addition On-demand mnbie: i'uell isalicuied to-ecoar of approved Jogalions and.under the coniol of 2 permit [ssued by Ihe iire code official.

6104.3 Logation of LP-g3s Gontainers Modification 1 New Fodiniots: gﬂggeciﬁes :sepacafions hetween ahive.ground L P-gascontainess and pohlic ways,

E102.1.7.1 Flazard Classification of - {Madification {This change revised the a)cdizer slagsification-of sodium dichiore-s-fierinetrione anhydrous (sodiuny dichloroisotyanurate anhydious).

Oxidizers ;

Chapter N Indoor Trade Shows and Additioh This fgw chapter provides speclﬁc reguiahcm toaddress the hmds associsted with lerge frade shows and extiiBitions. Many of the

{tegulations sanbe found elsewhere ity fhe IFC, but this appentix provides a single location with the regiéations dea[mg with these svenis.




PUBLIC HBARING NOTICE

Hannisal City Council witl conduet a public hearing on Tigsday, Febriary 20, 2024 at 6:45pm at.
City Hall i the Couneil Chambers-2™ Floor, 320 Broadway, Haanibal, MO to update fhe code
from 2012 t0 2018,



